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Legal Services Corporation § 1640.1 

§ 1639.1 Purpose. 
The purpose of this rule is to ensure 

that LSC recipients do not initiate liti-
gation involving, or challenge or par-
ticipate in, efforts to reform a Federal 
or State welfare system. The rule also 
clarifies when recipients may engage in 
representation on behalf of an indi-
vidual client seeking specific relief 
from a welfare agency and under what 
circumstances recipients may use 
funds from sources other than the Cor-
poration to comment on public rule-
making or respond to requests from 
legislative or administrative officials 
involving a reform of a Federal or 
State welfare system. 

§ 1639.2 Definitions. 
An effort to reform a Federal or 

State welfare system includes all of the 
provisions, except for the Child Sup-
port Enforcement provisions of Title 
III, of the Personal Responsibility and 
Work Opportunity Reconciliation Act 
of 1996 (Personal Responsibility Act), 
110 Stat. 2105 (1996), and subsequent leg-
islation enacted by Congress or the 
States to implement, replace or modify 
key components of the provisions of 
the Personal Responsibility Act or by 
States to replace or modify key compo-
nents of their General Assistance or 
similar means-tested programs con-
ducted by States or by counties with 
State funding or under State man-
dates. 

[67 FR 19343, Apr. 19, 2002] 

§ 1639.3 Prohibition. 
Except as provided in §§ 1639.4 and 

1639.5, recipients may not initiate legal 
representation, or participate in any 
other way in litigation, lobbying or 
rulemaking, involving an effort to re-
form a Federal or State welfare sys-
tem. Prohibited activities include par-
ticipation in: 

(a) Litigation challenging laws or 
regulations enacted as part of an effort 
to reform a Federal or State welfare 
system. 

(b) Rulemaking involving proposals 
that are being considered to implement 
an effort to reform a Federal or State 
welfare system. 

(c) Lobbying before legislative or ad-
ministrative bodies undertaken di-

rectly or through grassroots efforts in-
volving pending or proposed legislation 
that is part of an effort to reform a 
Federal or State welfare system. 

§ 1639.4 Permissible representation of 
eligible clients. 

Recipients may represent an indi-
vidual eligible client who is seeking 
specific relief from a welfare agency. 

[62 FR 30766, June 5, 1997, as amended at 67 
FR 19343, Apr. 19, 2002] 

§ 1639.5 Exceptions for public rule-
making and responding to requests 
with non-LSC funds. 

Consistent with the provisions of 45 
CFR 1612.6 (a) through (e), recipients 
may use non-LSC funds to comment in 
a public rulemaking proceeding or re-
spond to a written request for informa-
tion or testimony from a Federal, 
State or local agency, legislative body, 
or committee, or a member thereof, re-
garding an effort to reform a Federal 
or State welfare system. 

§ 1639.6 Recipient policies and proce-
dures. 

Each recipient shall adopt written 
policies and procedures to guide its 
staff in complying with this part. 
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§ 1640.1 Purpose. 

The purpose of this part is to ensure 
that recipients use their LSC funds in 
accordance with Federal law related to 
the proper use of Federal funds. This 
part also identifies the Federal laws 
which apply, and it provides notice of 
the consequences to a recipient of a 
violation of such Federal laws by a re-
cipient, its employees or board mem-
bers. 

VerDate Aug<31>2005 14:05 Nov 26, 2007 Jkt 211187 PO 00000 Frm 00461 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Y:\SGML\211187.XXX 211187rm
aj

et
te

 o
n 

P
R

O
D

1P
C

64
 w

ith
 C

F
R


