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Mine Safety and Health Admin., Labor § 75.361 

(10) Other areas where work or travel 
during the oncoming shift is scheduled 
prior to the beginning of the preshift 
examination. 

(c) The person conducting the 
preshift examination shall determine 
the volume of air entering each of the 
following areas if anyone is scheduled 
to work in the areas during the oncom-
ing shift: 

(1) In the last open crosscut of each 
set of entries or rooms on each working 
section and areas where mechanized 
mining equipment is being installed or 
removed. The last open crosscut is the 
crosscut in the line of pillars con-
taining the permanent stoppings that 
separate the intake air courses and the 
return air courses. 

(2) On each longwall or shortwall in 
the intake entry or entries at the in-
take end of the longwall or shortwall 
face immediately outby the face and 
the velocity of air at each end of the 
face at the locations specified in the 
approved ventilation plan. 

(3) At the intake end of any pillar 
line— 

(i) If a single split of air is used, in 
the intake entry furthest from the re-
turn air course, immediately outby the 
first open crosscut outby the line of 
pillars being mined; or 

(ii) If a split system is used, in the in-
take entries of each split immediately 
inby the split point. 

(d) The district manager may require 
the certified person to examine other 
areas of the mine or examine for other 
hazards during the preshift examina-
tion. 

(e) Certification. At each working 
place examined, the person doing the 
preshift examination shall certify by 
initials, date, and the time, that the 
examination was made. In areas re-
quired to be examined outby a working 
section, the certified person shall cer-
tify by initials, date, and the time at 
enough locations to show that the en-
tire area has been examined. 

(f) Recordkeeping. A record of the re-
sults of each preshift examination, in-
cluding a record of hazardous condi-
tions and their locations found by the 
examiner during each examination and 
of the results and locations of air and 
methane measurements, shall be made 
on the surface before any persons, 

other than certified persons conducting 
examinations required by this subpart, 
enter any underground area of the 
mine. The results of methane tests 
shall be recorded as the percentage of 
methane measured by the examiner. 
The record shall be made by the cer-
tified person who made the examina-
tion or by a person designated by the 
operator. If the record is made by 
someone other than the examiner, the 
examiner shall verify the record by ini-
tials and date by or at the end of the 
shift for which the examination was 
made. A record shall also be made by a 
certified person of the action taken to 
correct hazardous conditions found 
during the preshift examination. All 
preshift and corrective action records 
shall be countersigned by the mine 
foreman or equivalent mine official by 
the end of the mine foreman’s or equiv-
alent mine official’s next regularly 
scheduled working shift. The records 
required by this section shall be made 
in a secure book that is not susceptible 
to alteration or electronically in a 
computer system so as to be secure and 
not susceptible to alteration. 

(g) Retention period. Records shall be 
retained at a surface location at the 
mine for at least 1 year and shall be 
made available for inspection by au-
thorized representatives of the Sec-
retary and the representative of min-
ers. 

[61 FR 9829, Mar. 11, 1996, as amended at 61 
FR 55527, Oct. 25, 1996; 62 FR 35085, June 30, 
1997; 64 FR 45170, Aug. 19, 1999] 

§ 75.361 Supplemental examination. 

(a) Except for certified persons con-
ducting examinations required by this 
subpart, within 3 hours before anyone 
enters an area in which a preshift ex-
amination has not been made for that 
shift, a certified person shall examine 
the area for hazardous conditions, de-
termine whether the air is traveling in 
its proper direction and at its normal 
volume, and test for methane and oxy-
gen deficiency. 

(b) Certification. At each working 
place examined, the person making the 
supplemental examination shall certify 
by initials, date, and the time, that the 
examination was made. In areas re-
quired to be examined outby a working 
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section, the certified person shall cer-
tify by initials, date, and the time at 
enough locations to show that the en-
tire area has been examined. 

§ 75.362 On-shift examination. 
(a) (1) At least once during each shift, 

or more often if necessary for safety, a 
certified person designated by the oper-
ator shall conduct an on-shift examina-
tion of each section where anyone is 
assigned to work during the shift and 
any area where mechanized mining 
equipment is being installed or re-
moved during the shift. The certified 
person shall check for hazardous condi-
tions, test for methane and oxygen de-
ficiency, and determine if the air is 
moving in its proper direction. 

(2) A person designated by the oper-
ator shall conduct an examination to 
assure compliance with the respirable 
dust control parameters specified in 
the mine ventilation plan. In those in-
stances when a shift change is accom-
plished without an interruption in pro-
duction on a section, the examination 
shall be made anytime within 1 hour of 
the shift change. In those instances 
when there is an interruption in pro-
duction during the shift change, the ex-
amination shall be made before produc-
tion begins on a section. Deficiencies 
in dust controls shall be corrected be-
fore production begins or resumes. The 
examination shall include air quan-
tities and velocities, water pressures 
and flow rates, excessive leakage in the 
water delivery system, water spray 
numbers and orientations, section ven-
tilation and control device placement, 
and any other dust suppression meas-
ures required by the ventilation plan. 
Measurements of the air velocity and 
quantity, water pressure and flow rates 
are not required if continuous moni-
toring of these controls is used and in-
dicates that the dust controls are func-
tioning properly. 

(b) During each shift that coal is pro-
duced, a certified person shall examine 
for hazardous conditions along each 
belt conveyor haulageway where a belt 
conveyor is operated. This examination 
may be conducted at the same time as 
the preshift examination of belt con-
veyors and belt conveyor haulageways, 
if the examination is conducted within 
3 hours before the oncoming shift. 

(c) Persons conducting the on-shift 
examination shall determine at the fol-
lowing locations: 

(1) The volume of air in the last open 
crosscut of each set of entries or rooms 
on each section and areas where 
mechanized mining equipment is being 
installed or removed. The last open 
crosscut is the crosscut in the line of 
pillars containing the permanent 
stoppings that separate the intake air 
courses and the return air courses. 

(2) The volume of air on a longwall or 
shortwall, including areas where 
longwall or shortwall equipment is 
being installed or removed, in the in-
take entry or entries at the intake end 
of the longwall or shortwall. 

(3) The velocity of air at each end of 
the longwall or shortwall face at the 
locations specified in the approved ven-
tilation plan. 

(4) The volume of air at the intake 
end of any pillar line— 

(i) Where a single split of air is used 
in the intake entry furthest from the 
return air course immediately outby 
the first open crosscut outby the line 
of pillars being mined; or 

(ii) Where a split system is used in 
the intake entries of each split imme-
diately inby the split point. 

(d) (1) A qualified person shall make 
tests for methane— 

(i) At the start of each shift at each 
working place before electrically oper-
ated equipment is energized; and 

(ii) Immediately before equipment is 
energized, taken into, or operated in a 
working place; and 

(iii) At 20-minute intervals, or more 
often if required in the approved ven-
tilation plan at specific locations, dur-
ing the operation of equipment in the 
working place. 

(2) Except as provided for in para-
graph (d)(3) of this section, these meth-
ane tests shall be made at the face 
from under permanent roof support, 
using extendable probes or other ac-
ceptable means. When longwall or 
shortwall mining systems are used, 
these methane tests shall be made at 
the shearer, the plow, or the cutting 
head. When mining has been stopped 
for more than 20 minutes, methane 
tests shall be conducted prior to the 
start up of equipment. 
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