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DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES
FOOD AND DRUG AOMINISTRATION

SISTRICT OFFICE ADDRESS AND PHONE NUMBER — — T OATLE{STOF INSPEeTIoN
International Compliance Tcam, DMPQIDCJCDER FDA - Fab. 20, 21, 22 25 & 26, 2008

White Oak Buiding 51, 4™ Floor | FEL NUMBER
10903 New Jlampshlre Avenue

e Siver Spring MD 20693 _Usp__ (3010827 -g94 2 @D | .
£ AND TITLE OF INDIVIOUAL TO wHOM REPORT I8 {8SUED e

oy -y

TO: My, Yan'Wang, Genoral Mannger _
FIRMNAME “HTREET ADDRESS i -
Changzhou S8PL Company, Ltd 3 Changhonfy Weat Road

TYPE OF ESTABLIBHMENT INSPECTED

Wujingf, Changzhou City, Jiangsu valnca, China APR| {animal mngm) Manufaclurer

i{i5 DORUMENT LI5S GSERVATIONS MADE BY THE FA REPRE SENTATIVE(S) DURING THE INGPECTION OF YOUR FACILITY. THEY ARE INSPELTIONAL OBRERVATIONG, ANG DO NOT
REPRESENT A FINAL AGENCY DETERMINATION REGARDING YOUR COMPLIANCE. IF YOU HAVE AN ORJECTION REGARDING AN OBSERVATION, OR HAVE IMPLEMENTED, OR PLANTO
IMPLEMENY, CORRECTIVE ACTION IN RESFONSE TG AN OBSERVATION. YOU MAY DISCUSS THE ORJECTION OR ACTION WITH THE FOW REPRESENTATIVE(S) DURING THE INSPECTION
OR SUBMIT THS INEGRMATION TO FDA AT THE ADDRESS ABOVE. I YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS, PLEASE CONTAGT FDA AT THE PHONE NUMBER AND ADORESS ABOVE.

CITY. STATE AND ZiR CODE

DURING AN INSPECTION OF YOURFIRMwe OBRRERVED: g
1. Thers have been no critical processing steps jdentiticd for the Heparm Sodium U QPL :}pru;..cs& and, the repeated

and efficient removal of impurities, such as proteins, nucleotides, virus, endamgm bacteria md heavy metals al the appropriate,
SP"C'ﬁECL process steps has not been evaluated. There was no report for annual j}cﬂl results nvailable.

The Jmpm'.fﬂme:nts oftered by z;cm':wal of 3 raw 1 ,J test @Ti J a hatch size increase, an ﬂddﬂd
lﬁ . isicp, a change m) - ‘!fur th ﬁ”tﬂﬁ an ! . @1 and pRrameter changes
Ppm"ﬁd in"’ 1/05 process validalion report fur eparin 1Um USP wire nm dcmamtratﬂd -

2. There has been no impunty pmf' ile established for Hapaﬁn Sodium USP and no evaluation for degradants during stability
pmgmm testing.

3. The manufacturing instructions for Heparin Sodium USP are incompiete in that they do not include a description ,gf mtmual
manipulations nf'th {during, processing steps, they do not include the actuul, manually entered .

temupergtures and times and, ﬂpﬂ‘t ator observations such as level measurements, used in calculations, during thﬁL. 1stﬂp ate

not recorded.
4. There has been po test method verification performed for the reported USP test methods, Nitrogen Determmunstion, Protein and
Tota! Acrobic Microbial Count, employed in esting of Heparin Sodium USP and Heparin-Crude mae rialg, W show that the
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meothods are Sultﬂble llﬂ(ll‘..-l" achal mndmom of use, in wddition, there is no routine 1est me
ot release. ,

5. Investigations into failed lots and out of trend lols were approved as complete, but did not identify & cause for the problem.
For example, . |

Heparin Svdium USP batch T zfﬂllﬁd the Nitrogen Determination test and was reprocessed 10 mMuke L . ]
without finding the reasonfonthe shghtly high, Q0S8 Nitragen result. :
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hwastxgatmna INTO Sk wsmmﬁr ] pa'mﬁcmmn or Heparin Sodium USP lots et

tand i wer nowing w Y fed 16858 Meas urr..ment actually J'Eprmntﬂdﬁ
] Iﬂml ‘fﬂt: re. ﬂ'ﬁ lhc?l'ﬁ

. [nvc:stlgatmns into ROT out ol
inappropiiately as uutliers. o L
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6 Heparm Crude lotst - WJ
ﬂ]_mthgt _mc!uded ma.tmai from an unacceptable f.}rkshnp vendor were used in He;mrm Sudl Thy USP‘
j matrketed to the USA, . In addition, prior to 3/06 there arc nol }r&mrdq from vmdurL
ﬁshﬁwmg the source for their crude materlals,
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The inside surface of larye, “clemed“ - j;mksuwd in the final . jstep, afler both
i  |were very scratched, with unidentified maférial ndhering to the insides aud the inverted handlés held liguid, which,
spiiled to-the. botiom of the tunk when i it was upnighted, There was no written procedure showing that the tanks were dedicuted
to a particular pmcess rocess step. There y There WHS NQ dats cnllcmwd to verify marker and tape volume mm‘kmgs on the outside of the tunks

EE EMp OYEE(S) SIGNATIRE; EMPLOYEE(S) NAME AND TITLE (Prinfar Type) DATE [SSUED .
szgﬁg a?d«"ﬂ Ragina T. Brown, Invastigator Foh. 26, 2008
BAGE - ,r é ZI-Qlang Gu, Chamist
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1d  (P:2 B80@Z 92 ‘934 o ot DN xud

sidue amount at the time -

end results for Hep&nn Sodium USP hﬂﬁL . o jldﬁtiﬁ&d both l‘tbulth

. Whels



DEPARTMENT OF HEALTH AND HUMAN SERVICES
FOOD AND DRUG ADMINISTRATION |

BISTRICT OFFICE ADDRESS AND PHONE NUMBER e B NPESTION
Internaniongl Compliance ‘team, DMPOQ/OC/CDER, FI2A Feb. 20, 21, 22, 25 & 26, 2008
White Oak Buiding 51, 4" Floor FEINUMBER
10903 New Hampshire Avenue

Silver Spring, MD 20993 USA
NAME AND TITLE OF INDIVIDUAL TO WHOM REPORT IS 1ISSUED

TO: Mr. Yan Wang, General Manager
e S

Changzhou SPL Caoampany, Lo | 3 Changhong West Road
"CITY, STATE AND ZIP CODE 1 TYPE OF ESTABI

TYPE OF ESTABLISHMENT INSPECTED
Wullng, Changzhou City, Jlangsu Provings, China
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AP| {animal origin) Manufacturer

TR DOCUMENT LIS TS OBEERVATIONS MADE BY THE FDA REPRESENTATIVE(S) DURING THE INSPECTION OF YOUR FACILITY. YHEY ATLE INSPECTIONAL OBSERVATIONS, AND DQ NOT
REPRESIINT A FINAL AGENCY DETERMINATION REGARDING YOUR COMPLIANGE. (F YOU HAVE AN DBJECTION REGARDING AN DBSERVATION, OR HAVE IMPLEMENTED, OR PLAN YO
IMPLEMENT, CORRECTIVE ACTION (N RESPONSE TO AN ORSERVATION, YOU MAY DISCUSS THE ORJECTION OR ACTION WITH THE FDA REPRESENTATIVE(S) DURING THE INSPEGTION
OR SUBM!T THIS INFORMATION TO FDA AT THE ADDRESS ABOVE. IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS, PLEASE CONTACT FDA AT THE PHONL NUMBER ANL ADDRESS ABOVE.

DURING AN INSPECTION OF YOUR FIRMwa QBSTERVED; o
and, the cleaning method was not validated. It was noted that equipment cleaning tags were made of paper and taped (o the

picce of equipment unproteclod from liquids used in the processing room environments.

8. Raw material inventory records were incomplete inn that samples removed from the containers and the status and amount of
| materials retirned from use by the production processing department were 1ot recorded. Fury‘i{ m‘} stored in a {reczor,
the amount, condition and date of return was not recorded.

— " e

9. Control of material flow in the processing area was insdequata in that waste
in the processing area and nut provided for by the material flow written procedtire.

10, The outer foil hags containine Hoparin Sodium USP Tot Lj amsfactured and held since 5/25/07. are not labeled.
The drum lid showed the only indications of the lot nummber. o

11, There i3 no report or data to show that leachables for theE; """""""""""""""""""""""""" mEbags used to hold Heparin Sadium 1JS# {ot, have been
evaluated. e ' '
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DATE ISSUED
Feb. 28, 2008

EMPLOYEE(S) NAME AND TITLE (Prnt or Type)

T SEE T EMPLOY smstilﬁ.mfi

. H%?ﬁf}i ¢ Regina T. Brown, Invogtigator
PAGE - i . {7 ' él Zi-Chang Gu, Chﬁfﬂlﬁt

FORM FOA 483 (4/03) PREVIOLBADITION OBSOLETE (th:munawannsinoorry INGSPECTIONAL OBSERVATIONS
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The observations of objectionable conditions and practices listed on the front of this form
are reponed: |

1. ‘Pursuant to Section 704(b) of tha Federal Food, Drug and Cosmetic Act, or

2. To assist firms inspected in complying with the Acts and regulations enforced by thﬁ
Food and Drug Administration. |
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Section 704(b) of the Federal Food, Drug, and Cosmetic Act (21 USC 374(b)) provides:

"Upon completion of any such inspection of a factory, warehouse, consuiting
laboratory, or other establishment, and prior to leaving the premises, the officer or
employee making the inspection shall give to the owner, operator, or agent in charge a
report in wrting sefting forth any conditions or pmactices observed by him which, in hisg
juggment, Indicate that any food, drug, device, or cosmetic in such establishment (1)
consists in whole or in part of any fithy, putrid, or decomposed substance, or (2) has
been prepared, packed, or held under unsanitary conditions whereby it may have become
contaminated with filth, or wheraby it may have been rendered injurious to health. A copy

of such report shall be sant promptly to the Secretary.”

FORM FDA 483 (4/03)
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