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(4) Records related to evaluations: 
(i) Records pertaining to a deter-

mination by a substance abuse profes-
sional concerning a driver’s need for 
assistance; and 

(ii) Records concerning a driver’s 
compliance with recommendations of 
the substance abuse professional. 

(5) Records related to education and 
training: 

(i) Materials on alcohol misuse and 
controlled substance use awareness, in-
cluding a copy of the employer’s policy 
on alcohol misuse and controlled sub-
stance use; 

(ii) Documentation of compliance 
with the requirements of § 382.601, in-
cluding the driver’s signed receipt of 
education materials; 

(iii) Documentation of training pro-
vided to supervisors for the purpose of 
qualifying the supervisors to make a 
determination concerning the need for 
alcohol and/or controlled substances 
testing based on reasonable suspicion; 

(iv) Documentation of training for 
breath alcohol technicians as required 
by § 40.213(a) of this title; and 

(v) Certification that any training 
conducted under this part complies 
with the requirements for such train-
ing. 

(6) Administrative records related to 
alcohol and controlled substances test-
ing: 

(i) Agreements with collection site 
facilities, laboratories, breath alcohol 
technicians, screening test technicians, 
medical review officers, consortia, and 
third party service providers; 

(ii) Names and positions of officials 
and their role in the employer’s alcohol 
and controlled substances testing pro-
gram(s); 

(iii) Semi-annual laboratory statis-
tical summaries of urinalysis required 
by § 40.111(a) of this title; and 

(iv) The employer’s alcohol and con-
trolled substances testing policy and 
procedures. 

(d) Location of records. All records re-
quired by this part shall be maintained 
as required by § 390.31 of this sub-
chapter and shall be made available for 
inspection at the employee’s principal 
place of business within two business 
days after a request has been made by 
an authorized representative of the 

Federal Motor Carrier Safety Adminis-
tration. 

(e) OMB control number. (1) The infor-
mation collection requirements of this 
part have been reviewed by the Office 
of Management and Budget pursuant to 
the Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995 
(44 U.S.C. 3501 et seq.) and have been 
assigned OMB control number 2126–
0012. 

(2) The information collection re-
quirements of this part are found in 
the following sections: Sections 382.105, 
382.113, 382.301, 382.303, 382.305, 382.307, 
382.401, 382.403, 382.405, 382.409, 382.411, 
382.601, 382.603.

§ 382.403 Reporting of results in a 
management information system. 

(a) An employer shall prepare and 
maintain a summary of the results of 
its alcohol and controlled substances 
testing programs performed under this 
part during the previous calendar year, 
when requested by the Secretary of 
Transportation, any DOT agency, or 
any State or local officials with regu-
latory authority over the employer or 
any of its drivers. 

(b) If an employer is notified, during 
the month of January, of a request by 
the Federal Motor Carrier Safety Ad-
ministration to report the employer’s 
annual calendar year summary infor-
mation, the employer shall prepare and 
submit the report to the FMCSA by 
March 15 of that year. The employer 
shall ensure that the annual summary 
report is accurate and received by 
March 15 at the location that the 
FMCSA specifies in its request. The re-
port shall be in the form and manner 
prescribed by the FMCSA in its re-
quest. When the report is submitted to 
the FMCSA by mail or electronic 
transmission, the information re-
quested shall be typed, except for the 
signature of the certifying official. 
Each employer shall ensure the accu-
racy and timeliness of each report sub-
mitted by the employer or a consor-
tium. 

(c) Detailed summary. Each annual 
calendar year summary that contains 
information on a verified positive con-
trolled substances test result, an alco-
hol screening test result of 0.02 or 
greater, or any other violation of the 
alcohol misuse provisions of subpart B 
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of this part shall include the following 
informational elements: 

(1) Number of drivers subject to this 
part; 

(2) Number of drivers subject to test-
ing under the alcohol misuse or con-
trolled substances use rules of more 
than one DOT agency, identified by 
each agency; 

(3) Number of urine specimens col-
lected by type of test (e.g., pre-employ-
ment, random, reasonable suspicion, 
post-accident); 

(4) Number of positives verified by a 
MRO by type of test, and type of con-
trolled substance; 

(5) Number of negative controlled 
substance tests verified by a MRO by 
type of test; 

(6) Number of persons denied a posi-
tion as a driver following a pre-employ-
ment verified positive controlled sub-
stances test and/or a pre-employment 
alcohol test that indicates an alcohol 
concentration of 0.04 or greater; 

(7) Number of drivers with tests 
verified positive by a medical review 
officer for multiple controlled sub-
stances; 

(8) Number of drivers who refused to 
submit to an alcohol or controlled sub-
stances test required under this sub-
part, including those who submitted 
substituted or adulterated specimens; 

(9)(i) Number of supervisors who have 
received required alcohol training dur-
ing the reporting period; and 

(ii) Number of supervisors who have 
received required controlled substances 
training during the reporting period; 

(10)(i) Number of screening alcohol 
tests by type of test; and 

(ii) Number of confirmation alcohol 
tests, by type of test; 

(11) Number of confirmation alcohol 
tests indicating an alcohol concentra-
tion of 0.02 or greater but less than 0.04, 
by type of test; 

(12) Number of confirmation alcohol 
tests indicating an alcohol concentra-
tion of 0.04 or greater, by type of test; 

(13) Number of drivers who were re-
turned to duty (having complied with 
the recommendations of a substance 
abuse professional as described in 
§ 382.503 and part 40, subpart O of this 
title), in this reporting period, who pre-
viously: 

(i) Had a verified positive controlled 
substance test result, or 

(ii) Engaged in prohibited alcohol 
misuse under the provisions of this 
part; 

(14) Number of drivers who were ad-
ministered alcohol and drug tests at 
the same time, with both a verified 
positive drug test result and an alcohol 
test result indicating an alcohol con-
centration of 0.04 or greater; and 

(15) Number of drivers who were 
found to have violated any non-testing 
prohibitions of subpart B of this part, 
and any action taken in response to 
the violation. 

(d) Short summary. Each employer’s 
annual calendar year summary that 
contains only negative controlled sub-
stance test results, alcohol screening 
test results of less than 0.02, and does 
not contain any other violations of 
subpart B of this part, may prepare and 
submit, as required by paragraph (b) of 
this section, either a standard report 
form containing all the information 
elements specified in paragraph (c) of 
this section, or an ‘‘EZ’’ report form. 
The ‘‘EZ’’ report shall include the fol-
lowing information elements: 

(1) Number of drivers subject to this 
part; 

(2) Number of drivers subject to test-
ing under the alcohol misuse or con-
trolled substance use rules of more 
than one DOT agency, identified by 
each agency; 

(3) Number of urine specimens col-
lected by type of test (e.g., pre-employ-
ment, random, reasonable suspicion, 
post-accident); 

(4) Number of negatives verified by a 
medical review officer by type of test; 

(5) Number of drivers who refused to 
submit to an alcohol or controlled sub-
stances test required under this sub-
part, including those who submitted 
substituted or adulterated specimens; 

(6)(i) Number of supervisors who have 
received required alcohol training dur-
ing the reporting period; and 

(ii) Number of supervisors who have 
received required controlled substances 
training during the reporting period; 

(7) Number of screen alcohol tests by 
type of test; and 

(8) Number of drivers who were re-
turned to duty (having complied with 
the recommendations of a substance 
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abuse professional as described in 
§ 382.503 and part 40, subpart O, of this 
title), in this reporting period, who pre-
viously: 

(i) Had a verified positive controlled 
substance test result, or 

(ii) Engaged in prohibited alcohol 
misuse under the provisions of this 
part. 

(e) Each employer that is subject to 
more than one DOT agency alcohol or 
controlled substances rule shall iden-
tify each driver covered by the regula-
tions of more than one DOT agency. 
The identification will be by the total 
number of covered functions. Prior to 
conducting any alcohol or controlled 
substances test on a driver subject to 
the rules of more than one DOT agen-
cy, the employer shall determine which 
DOT agency rule or rules authorizes or 
requires the test. The test result infor-
mation shall be directed to the appro-
priate DOT agency or agencies. 

(f) A C/TPA may prepare annual cal-
endar year summaries and reports on 
behalf of individual employers for pur-
poses of compliance with this section. 
However, each employer shall sign and 
submit such a report and shall remain 
responsible for ensuring the accuracy 
and timeliness of each report prepared 
on its behalf by a C/TPA.

§ 382.405 Access to facilities and 
records. 

(a) Except as required by law or ex-
pressly authorized or required in this 
section, no employer shall release driv-
er information that is contained in 
records required to be maintained 
under § 382.401. 

(b) A driver is entitled, upon written 
request, to obtain copies of any records 
pertaining to the driver’s use of alcohol 
or controlled substances, including any 
records pertaining to his or her alcohol 
or controlled substances tests. The em-
ployer shall promptly provide the 
records requested by the driver. Access 
to a driver’s records shall not be con-
tingent upon payment for records other 
than those specifically requested. 

(c) Each employer shall permit ac-
cess to all facilities utilized in com-
plying with the requirements of this 
part to the Secretary of Transpor-
tation, any DOT agency, or any State 
or local officials with regulatory au-

thority over the employer or any of its 
drivers. 

(d) Each employer shall make avail-
able copies of all results for employer 
alcohol and/or controlled substances 
testing conducted under this part and 
any other information pertaining to 
the employer’s alcohol misuse and/or 
controlled substances use prevention 
program, when requested by the Sec-
retary of Transportation, any DOT 
agency, or any State or local officials 
with regulatory authority over the em-
ployer or any of its drivers. 

(e) When requested by the National 
Transportation Safety Board as part of 
an accident investigation, employers 
shall disclose information related to 
the employer’s administration of a 
post-accident alcohol and/or controlled 
substance test administered following 
the accident under investigation. 

(f) Records shall be made available to 
a subsequent employer upon receipt of 
a written request from a driver. Disclo-
sure by the subsequent employer is per-
mitted only as expressly authorized by 
the terms of the driver’s request. 

(g) An employer may disclose infor-
mation required to be maintained 
under this part pertaining to a driver 
to the decision maker in a lawsuit, 
grievance, or administrative pro-
ceeding initiated by or on behalf of the 
individual, and arising from a positive 
DOT drug or alcohol test or a refusal to 
test (including, but not limited to, 
adulterated or substituted test results) 
of this part (including, but not limited 
to, a worker’s compensation, unem-
ployment compensation, or other pro-
ceeding relating to a benefit sought by 
the driver). Additionally, an employer 
may disclose information in criminal 
or civil actions in accordance with 
§ 40.323(a)(2) of this title. 

(h) An employer shall release infor-
mation regarding a driver’s records as 
directed by the specific written consent 
of the driver authorizing release of the 
information to an identified person. 
Release of such information by the per-
son receiving the information is per-
mitted only in accordance with the 
terms of the employee’s specific writ-
ten consent as outlined in § 40.321(b) of 
this title.
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