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Tier II equipment based on an analysis 
completed pursuant to the railroad’s 
safety plan. The maintenance interval 
of a safety-critical component shall be 
changed only when justified by accu-
mulated, verifiable operating data and 
approved by FRA under § 238.505 before 
the change takes effect. 

(h) Training, qualification, and des-
ignation program. The program under 
paragraph (a) of this section shall de-
scribe the training, qualification, and 
designation program, as defined in the 
training program plan under § 238.109, 
established by the railroad to qualify 
individuals to inspect, test, and main-
tain the equipment. 

(1) If the railroad deems it safety-
critical, then only qualified individuals 
shall inspect, test, and maintain the 
equipment. 

(2) Knowledge of the procedures de-
scribed in paragraph (a) of this section 
shall be required to qualify an em-
ployee or contractor to perform an in-
spection, testing, or maintenance task 
under this part. 

(i) Standard procedures. The program 
under paragraph (a) of this section 
shall include the railroad’s written 
standard procedures for performing all 
safety-critical equipment inspection, 
testing, maintenance, and repair tasks 
necessary to ensure the safe and proper 
operation of the equipment. The in-
spection, testing, and maintenance pro-
gram required by this section is not in-
tended to address and should not in-
clude procedures to address employee 
working conditions that arise in the 
course of conducting the inspections, 
tests, and maintenance set forth in the 
program. When reviewing the railroad’s 
program, FRA does not intend to re-
view any portion of the program that 
relates to employee working condi-
tions. 

(j) Annual review. The inspection, 
testing, and maintenance program re-
quired by this section shall be reviewed 
by the railroad annually. 

(k) Quality control program. Each rail-
road shall establish an inspection, test-
ing, and maintenance quality control 
program enforced by railroad or con-
tractor supervisors to reasonably en-
sure that inspections, tests, and main-
tenance are performed in accordance 

with Federal safety standards and the 
procedures established by the railroad. 

(l) Identification of safety-critical items. 
In the program under paragraph (a) of 
this section, the railroad shall identify 
all inspection and testing procedures 
and criteria as well as all maintenance 
intervals that the railroad deems to be 
safety-critical. 

[64 25660, May 12, 1999, as amended at 67 FR 
19994, Apr. 23, 2002]

§ 238.505 Program approval procedure. 

(a) Submission. Not less than 90 days 
prior to commencing passenger oper-
ations using Tier II passenger equip-
ment, each railroad to which this sub-
part applies shall submit for approval 
an inspection, testing, and mainte-
nance program for that equipment 
meeting the requirements of this sub-
part with the Associate Administrator 
for Safety, Federal Railroad Adminis-
tration, 1120 Vermont Ave, Mail Stop 
25, Washington, DC 20590. If a railroad 
seeks to amend an approved program, 
the railroad shall file with FRA’s Asso-
ciate Administrator for Safety a peti-
tion for approval of such amendment 
not less than 60 days prior to the pro-
posed effective date of the amendment. 
A program responsive to the require-
ments of this subpart or any amend-
ment to the program shall not be im-
plemented prior to FRA approval. 

(1) Each program or amendment 
under § 238.503 shall contain: 

(i) The information prescribed in 
§ 238.503 for such program or amend-
ment; 

(ii) The name, title, address, and tele-
phone number of the primary person to 
be contacted with regard to review of 
the program or amendment; and 

(iii) A statement affirming that the 
railroad has served a copy of the pro-
gram or amendment on designated rep-
resentatives of railroad employees, to-
gether with a list of the names and ad-
dresses of persons served. 

(2) Each railroad shall serve a copy of 
each submission to FRA on designated 
representatives of railroad employees 
responsible for the equipment’s oper-
ation, inspection, testing, and mainte-
nance under this subpart. 

(b) Comment. Not later than 45 days 
from the date of filing the program or 
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amendment, any person may comment 
on the program or amendment. 

(1) Each comment shall set forth spe-
cifically the basis upon which it is 
made, and contain a concise statement 
of the interest of the commenter in the 
proceeding. 

(2) Three copies of each comment 
shall be submitted to the Associate Ad-
ministrator for Safety, Federal Rail-
road Administration, 1120 Vermont 
Ave., Mail Stop 25, Washington, DC 
20590. 

(3) The commenter shall certify that 
a copy of the comment was served on 
the railroad. 

(c) Approval.
(1) Within 60 days of receipt of each 

initial inspection, testing, and mainte-
nance program, FRA will conduct a 
formal review of the program. FRA will 
then notify the primary railroad con-
tact person and the designated em-
ployee representatives in writing 
whether the inspection, testing, and 
maintenance program is approved and, 
if not approved, the specific points in 
which the program is deficient. If a 
program is not approved by FRA, the 
railroad shall amend its program to 
correct all deficiencies and resubmit 
its program with the required revisions 
not later than 45 days prior to com-
mencing passenger operations. 

(2) FRA will review each proposed 
amendment to the program within 45 
days of receipt. FRA will then notify 
the primary railroad contact person 
and the designated employee represent-
atives in writing whether the proposed 
amendment has been approved by FRA 
and, if not approved, the specific points 
in which the proposed amendment is 
deficient. The railroad shall correct 
any deficiencies and file the corrected 
amendment prior to implementing the 
amendment. 

(3) Following initial approval of a 
program or amendment, FRA may re-
open consideration of the program or 
amendment for cause stated.

Subpart G—Specific Safety Plan-
ning Requirements for Tier II 
Passenger Equipment

§ 238.601 Scope. 
This subpart contains specific safety 

planning requirements for the oper-

ation of Tier II passenger equipment, 
procurement of Tier II passenger equip-
ment, and the introduction or major 
upgrade of new technology in existing 
Tier II passenger equipment that af-
fects a safety system on such equip-
ment.

§ 238.603 Safety planning require-
ments. 

(a) Prior to commencing revenue 
service operation of Tier II passenger 
equipment, each railroad shall prepare 
and execute a written plan for the safe 
operation of such equipment. The plan 
may be combined with any other plan 
required under this part. The plan shall 
be updated at least every 365 days. At a 
minimum, the plan shall describe the 
approaches and processes to: 

(1) Identify all requirements nec-
essary for the safe operation of the 
equipment in its operating environ-
ment; 

(2) Identify all known or potential 
hazards to the safe operation of the 
equipment; 

(3) Eliminate or reduce the risk posed 
by each hazard identified to an accept-
able level using a formal safety meth-
odology such as MIL-STD–882; and 

(4) Impose operational limitations, as 
necessary, on the operation of the 
equipment if the equipment cannot 
meet safety requirements. 

(b) For the procurement of Tier II 
passenger equipment, and for each 
major upgrade or introduction of new 
technology in existing Tier II pas-
senger equipment that affects a safety 
system on such equipment, each rail-
road shall prepare and execute a writ-
ten safety plan. The plan may be com-
bined with any other plan required 
under this part. The plan shall describe 
the approaches and processes to: 

(1) Identify all safety requirements 
governing the design of the passenger 
equipment and its supporting systems; 

(2) Evaluate the total system, includ-
ing hardware, software, testing, and 
support activities, to identify known or 
potential safety hazards over the life 
cycle of the equipment; 

(3) Identify safety issues during de-
sign reviews; 
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