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(h) Non-commercial scientific institution 
means an institution that is not oper-
ated on a commercial basis and that is 
operated solely for the purpose of con-
ducting scientific research, the results 
of which are not intended to promote 
any particular product or industry. 

(i) Representative of the news media 
means any person actively gathering 
news for an entity that is organized 
and operated to publish or broadcast 
news to the public. 

(1) Factors indicating such represen-
tation status include press accredita-
tion, guild membership, a history of 
continuing publication, business reg-
istration, and/or Federal Communica-
tion Commission licensing, among oth-
ers. 

(2) For purposes of this definition, 
news contemplates information that is 
about current events or that would be 
of current interest to the public. 

(3) A freelance journalist will be 
treated as a representative of the news 
media if the person can demonstrate a 
solid basis for expecting publication of 
matters related to the requested infor-
mation through a qualifying news 
media entity. A publication contract 
with a qualifying news media entity 
satisfies this requirement. An individ-
ual’s past publication record with such 
organizations is also relevant in mak-
ing this determination. Examples of 
news media entities include television 
or radio stations broadcasting to the 
public at large, and publishers of peri-
odicals including newsletters (but only 
in those instances where they can qual-
ify as disseminators of news) who make 
their products available for purchase or 
subscription by the general public. 

§ 70.39 Statutes specifically providing 
for setting of fees. 

This subpart will not apply to fees 
charged under any statute, other than 
the FOIA, that specifically requires an 
agency to set and collect fees for par-
ticular types of records. 

§ 70.40 Charges assessed for the pro-
duction of records. 

(a) General. There are three types of 
charges assessed in connection with 
the production of records in response 
to a request, charges for costs associ-
ated with: 

(1) Searching for or locating respon-
sive records (search costs), 

(2) Reproducing such records (repro-
duction costs), and 

(3) Reviewing records to determine 
whether any materials are exempt (re-
view costs). 

(b)(1) There are four types of request-
ers: 

(i) Commercial use requesters, 
(ii) Educational and non-commercial 

scientific institutions, 
(iii) Representatives of the news 

media, and 
(iv) All other requesters. 
(2) Depending upon the type of re-

quester, as set forth in paragraph (b)(1) 
of this section, the charges outlined in 
paragraph (c) of this section may be as-
sessed. 

(c) Types of charges that will be as-
sessed for each type of request. (1) Com-
mercial use request. When a requester 
makes a commercial use request, 
search costs, reproduction costs and re-
view costs will be assessed in their en-
tirety. 

(2) Educational or non-commercial sci-
entific institution request. When an edu-
cational or non-commercial scientific 
institution makes a request, only re-
production costs will be assessed, ex-
cluding charges for the first 100 pages. 

(3) Request by representative of news 
media. When a representative of the 
news media makes a request, only re-
production costs will be assessed, ex-
cluding charges for the first 100 pages. 

(4) All other requests. Requesters mak-
ing a request which does not fall within 
paragraphs (c)(1), (2), or (3) of this sec-
tion will be charged search costs and 
reproduction costs, except that the 
first 100 pages of reproduction and the 
first two hours of search time will be 
furnished without charge. Where com-
puter searches are involved, the mone-
tary equivalent of two hours of search 
time by a professional employee will be 
deducted from the total cost of com-
puter processing time. 

(d) Charges for each type of activity. (1) 
Search costs. (i) When a search for 
records is performed by a clerical em-
ployee, a rate of $5.00 per quarter hour 
will be applicable. When a search is 
performed by professional or super-
visory personnel, a rate of $10.00 per 
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