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Citation 30 CFR 250 subpart C and 
NTL(s) Reporting and recordkeeping requirement Hour burden 

................................................................................................................ Unmanned facilities ¥ 
1⁄12 hr × 

every 3rd day (365/3 = 122 
days) = 10.17 

Estimated Reporting and 
Recordkeeping ‘‘Non-Hour Cost’’ 
Burden: We have identified no non-hour 
cost burdens for this collection. 

Public Disclosure Statement: The PRA 
(44 U.S.C. 3501, et seq.) provides that an 
agency may not conduct or sponsor a 
collection of information unless it 
displays a currently valid OMB control 
number. Until OMB approves a 
collection of information, you are not 
obligated to respond. 

Comments: Before submitting an ICR 
to OMB, PRA section 3506(c)(2)(A) 
requires each agency ‘‘* * * to provide 
notice * * * and otherwise consult 
with members of the public and affected 
agencies concerning each proposed 
collection of information * * *’’. 
Agencies must specifically solicit 
comments to: (a) Evaluate whether the 
proposed collection of information is 
necessary for the agency to perform its 
duties, including whether the 
information is useful; (b) evaluate the 
accuracy of the agency’s estimate of the 
burden of the proposed collection of 
information; (c) enhance the quality, 
usefulness, and clarity of the 
information to be collected; and (d) 
minimize the burden on the 
respondents, including the use of 
automated collection techniques or 
other forms of information technology. 

Agencies must also estimate the ‘‘non- 
hour cost’’ burdens to respondents or 
recordkeepers resulting from the 
collection of information. Therefore, if 
you have costs to generate, maintain, 
and disclose this information, you 
should comment and provide your total 
capital and startup cost components or 
annual operation, maintenance, and 
purchase of service components. You 
should describe the methods you use to 
estimate major cost factors, including 
system and technology acquisition, 
expected useful life of capital 
equipment, discount rate(s), and the 
period over which you incur costs. 
Capital and startup costs include, 
among other items, computers and 
software you purchase to prepare for 
collecting information, monitoring, and 
record storage facilities. You should not 
include estimates for equipment or 
services purchased: (i) Before October 1, 
1995; (ii) to comply with requirements 
not associated with the information 
collection; (iii) for reasons other than to 
provide information or keep records for 

the Government; or (iv) as part of 
customary and usual business or private 
practices. 

We will summarize written responses 
to this notice and address them in our 
submission for OMB approval. As a 
result of your comments, we will make 
any necessary adjustments to the burden 
in our submission to OMB. 

Public Comment Procedures: Before 
including your address, phone number, 
email address, or other personal 
identifying information in your 
comment, you should be aware that 
your entire comment-including your 
personal identifying information-may be 
made publicly available at any time. 
While you can ask us in your comment 
to withhold your personal identifying 
information from public review, we 
cannot guarantee that we will be able to 
do so. 

MMS Information Collection 
Clearance Officer: Arlene Bajusz (202) 
208–7744. 

Dated: May 20, 2008. 
E.P. Danenberger, 
Chief, Office of Offshore Regulatory Programs. 
[FR Doc. E8–11809 Filed 5–27–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4310–MR–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Investigation No. 332–352] 

Andean Trade Preference Act: Impact 
on the U.S. Economy and on Andean 
Drug Crop Eradication 

AGENCY: United States International 
Trade Commission. 
ACTION: Notice of public hearing and 
opportunity to submit comments in 
connection with the 2007 report on the 
Andean Trade Preference Act (ATPA). 

SUMMARY: Section 206 of the ATPA (19 
U.S.C. 3204) requires the Commission to 
report biennially to the Congress by 
September 30 of each reporting year on 
the economic impact of the Act on U.S. 
industries and U.S. consumers, as well 
as on the effectiveness of the Act in 
promoting drug-related crop eradication 
and crop substitution efforts by 
beneficiary countries. This series of 
biennial reports was instituted as 
investigation No. 332–352, Andean 
Trade Preference Act: Impact on the 

U.S. Economy and on Andean Drug 
Crop Eradication. The Commission has 
scheduled a public hearing for its 2008 
ATPA report, covering calendar year 
2007, for July 22, 2008. 
DATES: July 9, 2008: Deadline for filing 
requests to appear at the public hearing. 

July 15, 2008: Deadline for filing pre- 
hearing briefs and statements. 

July 22, 2008: Public hearing. 
July 29, 2008: Deadline for filing post- 

hearing briefs and statements and all 
other written submissions. 

September 30, 2008: Transmittal of 
Commission report to Committee on 
Ways and Means. 
ADDRESSES: All Commission offices, 
including the Commission’s hearing 
rooms, are located in the United States 
International Trade Commission 
Building, 500 E Street, SW., 
Washington, DC. All written 
submissions should be addressed to the 
Secretary, United States International 
Trade Commission, 500 E Street, SW., 
Washington, DC 20436. The public 
record for this investigation may be 
viewed on the Commission’s electronic 
docket (EDIS) at http://www.usitc.gov/ 
secretary/edis.htm. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
James Stamps (202–205–3227, or 
james.stamps@usitc.gov) or Nannette 
Christ (202–205–3263, or 
nannette.christ@usitc.gov), Country and 
Regional Analysis Division, Office of 
Economics, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, Washington, DC 20436. 
General information concerning the 
Commission may be obtained by 
accessing its Internet server (http:// 
www.usitc.gov). 

Background: Section 206 of the 
Andean Trade Preference Act (ATPA) 
(19 U.S.C. 3204) requires that the 
Commission submit biennial reports to 
the Congress regarding the economic 
impact of the Act on U.S. industries and 
consumers and, in conjunction with 
other agencies, the effectiveness of the 
Act in promoting drug-related crop 
eradication and crop substitution efforts 
of the beneficiary countries. Section 
206(b) of the Act requires that each 
report include: 

(1) The actual effect of ATPA on the 
U.S. economy generally as well as on 
specific domestic industries which 
produce articles that are like, or directly 
competitive with, articles being 
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imported under the Act from beneficiary 
countries; 

(2) the probable future effect that 
ATPA will have on the U.S. economy 
generally and on such domestic 
industries; and 

(3) the estimated effect that ATPA has 
had on drug-related crop eradication 
and crop substitution efforts of 
beneficiary countries. 

Notice of institution of the 
investigation and the schedule for such 
reports under section 206 of ATPA was 
published in the Federal Register of 
March 10, 1994 (59 FR 11308). The 
thirteenth report, covering calendar year 
2007, is to be submitted by September 
30, 2008. 

Public Hearing: A public hearing in 
connection with this investigation will 
be held at the U.S. International Trade 
Commission Building, 500 E Street, 
SW., Washington, DC, beginning at 9:30 
a.m. on July 22, 2008. Requests to 
appear at the public hearing should be 
filed with the Secretary, no later than 
5:15 p.m., July 9, 2008, in accordance 
with the requirements in the 
‘‘Submissions’’ section below. All pre- 
hearing briefs and statements should be 
filed not later than 5:15 p.m., July 15, 
2008, and all post-hearing briefs and 
statements should be filed not later than 
5:15 p.m., July 29, 2008. In the event 
that, as of the close of business on July 
9, 2008, no witnesses are scheduled to 
appear at the hearing, the hearing will 
be canceled. Any person interested in 
attending the hearing as an observer or 
nonparticipant may call the Secretary to 
the Commission (202–205–2000) after 
July 9, 2008, for information concerning 
whether the hearing will be held. 

Written Submissions: In lieu of or in 
addition to participating in the hearing, 
interested parties are invited to submit 
written statements concerning this 
investigation. All written submissions 
should be addressed to the Secretary, 
and should be received not later than 
5:15 p.m., July 29, 2008. All written 
submissions must conform with the 
provisions of section 201.8 of the 
Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (19 CFR 201.8). Section 201.8 
requires that a signed original (or a copy 
so designated) and fourteen (14) copies 
of each document be filed. In the event 
that confidential treatment of a 
document is requested, at least four (4) 
additional copies must be filed, in 
which the confidential information 
must be deleted (see the following 
paragraph for further information 
regarding confidential business 
information). The Commission’s rules 
authorize filing submissions with the 
Secretary by facsimile or electronic 
means only to the extent permitted by 

section 201.8 of the rules (see Handbook 
for Electronic Filing Procedures, http:// 
www.usitc.gov/secretary/ 
fed_reg_notices/rules/documents/ 
handbook_on_electronic_filing.pdf). 
Persons with questions regarding 
electronic filing should contact the 
Secretary (202–205–2000). 

Any submissions that contain 
confidential business information must 
also conform with the requirements of 
section 201.6 of the Commission’s Rules 
of Practice and Procedure (19 CFR 
201.6). Section 201.6 of the rules 
requires that the cover of the document 
and the individual pages be clearly 
marked as to whether they are the 
‘‘confidential’’ or ‘‘non-confidential’’ 
version, and that the confidential 
business information be clearly 
identified by means of brackets. All 
written submissions, except for 
confidential business information, will 
be made available for inspection by 
interested parties. 

Committee staff has indicated that the 
Committee intends to make the 
Commission’s report available to the 
public in its entirety, and has asked that 
the Commission not include any 
confidential business information or 
national security classified information 
in the report that the Commission sends 
to the Committee. Any confidential 
business information received by the 
Commission in this investigation and 
used in preparing this report will not be 
published in a manner that would 
reveal the operations of the firm 
supplying the information. 

Issued: May 21, 2008. 
By order of the Commission. 

Marilyn R. Abbott, 
Secretary to the Commission. 
[FR Doc. E8–11842 Filed 5–27–08; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 7020–02–P 

INTERNATIONAL TRADE 
COMMISSION 

[Inv. No. 337–TA–649] 

In the Matter of Certain Semiconductor 
Chips with Minimized Chip Package 
Size and Products Containing Same 
(IV); Notice of Investigation 

AGENCY: U.S. International Trade 
Commission. 
ACTION: Institution of investigation 
pursuant to 19 U.S.C. 1337. 

SUMMARY: Notice is hereby given that a 
complaint was filed with the U.S. 
International Trade Commission on 
April 21, 2008, under section 337 of the 
Tariff Act of 1930, as amended, 19 
U.S.C. 1337, on behalf of Tessera, Inc. 

of San Jose, California. A supplement to 
the complaint was filed on May 14, 
2008. The complaint alleges violations 
of section 337 based upon the 
importation into the United States, the 
sale for importation, and the sale within 
the United States after importation of 
certain semiconductor chips with 
minimized chip package size and 
products containing same that infringe 
certain claims of U.S. Patent No. 
5,679,977, U.S. Patent No. 5,852,326 
and U.S. Patent No. 6,433,419. The 
complaint further alleges that an 
industry in the United States exists as 
required by subsection (a)(2) of section 
337. 

The complainant requests that the 
Commission institute an investigation 
and, after the investigation, issue 
exclusion orders and cease and desist 
orders. 

ADDRESSES: The complaint, except for 
any confidential information contained 
therein, is available for inspection 
during official business hours (8:45 a.m. 
to 5:15 p.m.) in the Office of the 
Secretary, U.S. International Trade 
Commission, 500 E Street, SW., Room 
112, Washington, DC 20436, telephone 
202–205–2000. Hearing impaired 
individuals are advised that information 
on this matter can be obtained by 
contacting the Commission’s TDD 
terminal on 202–205–1810. Persons 
with mobility impairments who will 
need special assistance in gaining access 
to the Commission should contact the 
Office of the Secretary at 202–205–2000. 
General information concerning the 
Commission may also be obtained by 
accessing its internet server at http:// 
www.usitc.gov. The public record for 
this investigation may be viewed on the 
Commission’s electronic docket (EDIS) 
at http://edis.usitc.gov. 
FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
Kecia J. Reynolds, Esq., Office of Unfair 
Import Investigations, U.S. International 
Trade Commission, telephone (202) 
205–2580. 

Authority: The authority for 
institution of this investigation is 
contained in section 337 of the Tariff 
Act of 1930, as amended, and in section 
210.10 of the Commission’s Rules of 
Practice and Procedure, 19 CFR 210.10 
(2007). 

Scope of Investigation: Having 
considered the complaint, the U.S. 
International Trade Commission, on 
May 20, 2008, ordered that— 

(1) Pursuant to subsection (b) of 
section 337 of the Tariff Act of 1930, as 
amended, an investigation be instituted 
to determine whether there is a 
violation of subsection (a)(1)(B) of 
section 337 in the importation into the 
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