“HAWAI | ADM NI STRATI VE RULES

TITLE 12

DEPARTMENT OF LABOR AND | NDUSTRI AL RELATI ONS

Subchapt er

§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.

§12-45.

§12-45.

§12-45.

§12-45.

Subchapt er

PR
ghwN Rk

1-6

1-7

1-8

1-9

SUBTI TLE 7
BOARDS
CHAPTER 45.1
STATE FI RE COUNCI L

STATE FI RE CODE

1 Rul es of General Applicability

Pur pose

Scope

Definitions

Adoption of the UniformFire Code

Adopti on of and anendnents to UFC
Appendi x I-C, “Stairway
| dentification”

Adopti on of UFC Appendix I11-C,
“Inspection, Testing and Mi nt enance
of Water-Based Fire Protection
Systens”

Adoption of UFC Appendi x VI -A,
“Hazardous Materials Cassifications

Adopti on of UFC Appendi x VI-B, “Hazard
Ranki ng”

Permt authorization

2 Amendnents to the 1997 Uni form
Fire Code and the 1998 and 1999
Suppl enent s

45.1-1



§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.

§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.

§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.

§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.
§12-45.

§12-45.

§12-45.
§12-45.

1-10
1-11
1-12
1-13

1-14
1-15
1-16
1-17
1-18
1-19
1-20
1-21
1-22
1-23
1-24
1-25
1-26

1-27
1-28
1-29
1-30
1-31
1-32
1-33
1-34
1-35

1-36
1- 37
1-38
1-39
1-40
1-41

1-42

Title

Appeal s

Gener al

Fire prevention bureau personnel and
police

Aut hority to inspect

Unsaf e buil di ngs

| nvesti gati ons

Adj uster’s report

Permt required

Definitions and abbrevi ations

Permts and pl ans

Di nensi ons

Tur ni ng radi us

Dead ends

Bri dges

G ade

Required water supply for fire
protection

Testi ng and mai nt enance

Required install ations

Instal |l ati on acceptance testing

| nspection and testing

Systens in high-rise buildings

Snoke-control systens

Speci al hazards

Gener al

Al'l occupanci es except G oup R
Division 3 and Group U occupanci es

Amusenent bui | di ngs

G oup M occupanci es

Goup R, Division 1 occupancies

Gener al

Required install ations

Location of Class | standpi pe hose
connecti ons

Location of Class IlIl standpi pe hose
connecti ons

Oper ati ons and mai nt enance

Gener al

45.1-2



812-45. 1-45 Gener al

8§12-45. 1-46 Exi sting Group R occupancies

8§12-45. 1- 47 Fire departnment comuni cation system

8§12-45. 1-48 Central control station

812-45. 1-49 Manual fire al arm boxes

§12-45.1-50 Annunci at or panel

812-45.1-51 Gener al

§12-45. 1-52 Fire alarm system nodi fied positive
al ar m sequence

8§12-45. 1-53 Audibility

§12-45.1-54 Permits and pl ans

§12-45.1-55 | nci nerators

8§12-45. 1- 56 Gener al

§12-45.1-57 Material restrictions

812-45. 1-58 Nonnetal | i ¢ contai ners

8§12-45. 1-59 Textile and filmmaterials

8§12-45. 1- 60 Wood

8§12-45.1-61 Foam pl astics

§12-45.1-62 Par ade fl oats

§12-45.1-63 No snoking signs

8§12-45. 1- 64 Theatri cal perfornmances

§12-45.1-65 | denti fication

§12-45.1-66 Addi ti onal doors

812-45. 1- 67 Lat ch

§12-45.1-68 El evator identification

812-45. 1- 69 Fire drills

812-45.1-70 Permts

§12-45.1-71 Permits and pl ans

8§12-45.1-72 Decorative materials

8§12-45.1-73 Pl an of exit ways and aisles

8§12-45.1-74 Det ermi nati on of occupant | oad

812-45.1-75 Candl es and ot her open-flanme devices

8§12-45.1-76 Port abl e heating equi pnent

8§12-45. 1-77 Permts

8§12-45.1-78 Permts

8§12-45.1-79 Permts

8§12-45. 1- 80 Permts

8§12-45. 1-81 Scope

8§12-45. 1- 82 Permts

8§12-45. 1-83 Permts

812-45.1-84 Permts

8§12-45. 1- 85 Permts

45.1-3



8§12-45. 1- 86 Permts

812-45. 1-87 Permts

§12-45. 1- 88 Permts

8§12-45. 1-89 Fum gation and thermal insecticide
f oggi ng

§12-45.1-90 Permts

8§12-45.1-91 Permts

§12-45.1-92 Permts

§12-45. 1-93 Permts

8§12-45. 1-94 Permts and pl ans

8§12-45.1-95 Permts

§12-45.1-96 Permits and pl ans

812-45. 1-97 Permits and pl ans

§12-45. 1-98 Permts

8§12-45. 1-99 Permts

§12-45. 1- 100 Permts

§12-45.1-101 Tank vehicles

812-45. 1- 102 Permts

8§12-45.1-103 Explosive materials

§12-45.1-104 Permts

812-45.1- 105 Sei zure of fireworks

8§12-45.1-106  Prohibition

§12-45.1-107 General

8§12-45.1-108 Display of fireworks for retail sales

8§12-45.1-109 Pernits and pl ans

812-45.1-110 Gener al

812-45.1-111 Label or placard

§12-45. 1-112 Tanks abandoned in pl ace

812-45.1-113 Gener al

8§12-45.1-114 Hazardous materi al s managenent pl an

8§12-45. 1- 115 Hazardous materials inventory
st at enent

812-45.1-116 Protection from vehicles

8§12-45.1-117 Permits and plan subnittal

8§12-45.1-118 PERM TS, PLANS AND RECORDS

§12-45.1-119  General

§12-45.1-120 Permts

8§12-45.1-121  Asbestos renpoval

§12-45.1-122 Permts

812-45.1-123 Recogni zed st andar ds

45.1-4



§12-45.1-3

Hi storical Note: Chapter 12-45.1 is based
substantially upon chapter 12-45, subchapter 1. [Eff
6/ 6/ 86; am and conp 8/ 13/87; am and conp 4/18/92;

R ]

SUBCHAPTER 1

RULES OF GENERAL APPLI CABI LI TY

8§12-45.1-1 Purpose. The purpose of this chapter
is to adopt the state fire code as required by section
132-3, Hawaii Revised Statutes (HRS). [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3)(lnp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-2 Scope. This chapter sets forth
m nimumrequirenents relative to the protection of
persons and property fromfire loss. [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3)(lnmp: HRS §132-3)

8§12-45.1-3 Definitions. In this chapter, unless
t he context otherw se requires:

“Appendi x” neans the appendi x attached to the
Uni form Fi re Code.

“Article” neans an article of the UFC

“Bui | ding code” neans the currently adopted,
respective county buil ding code.

“NFPA” means the National Fire Protection
Associ ati on.

“Section” neans a section of an article of the
UFC.

“Suppl ement” means the Accunul ative Suppl enent to
the UniformFire Code as copyrighted by the
International Fire Code Institute.

“UBC’ neans the Uniform Buil ding Code, as
copyrighted by the International Conference of

45.1-5



8§12-45.1-3

Building O ficials.

“UFC’ neans the Uniform Fire Code, 1997 edition,
as copyrighted by the International Conference of
Building Oficials and the Western Fire Chiefs
Associ ation and published by the International Fire
Code Institute. [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8§132-
3)(Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-4 Adoption of the Uniform Fire Code.
The UFC, as anended by the 1998 and 1999 Suppl enents,
is made a part of this chapter, subject to the
anmendnents provided in this chapter. The appendices
to the UFC are not adopted except as provided in this
chapter. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np:
HRS §132-3)]

8§12-45.1-5 Adoption of and anmendments to UFC
Appendix |-C, “Stairway lIdentification”. Appendix |I-C
is adopted. Section 2 of Appendix I-Cis anended to
read: “Standardi zed signs shall be provided in new
bui l di ngs that are four or nore stories in height.
Such signs shall be installed in stairways to identify
each stair |anding and indicate the upper and | ower
termnation of the stairway.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-6 Adoption of UFC Appendix I11-C
“Inspection, Testing and Mii ntenance of \Water-Based
Fire-Protection Systens”. Appendix I11-Cis adopted.
[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3)(lnp: HRS
§132- 3)

8§12-45.1-7 Adoption of UFC Appendi x VI-A,
“Hazardous Materials Cassifications”. Appendix VI-A

45.1-6



8§12-45.1-11

is adopted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-
3) (I np: HRS 8§132-3)

8§12-45.1-8 Adoption of UFC Appendi x VI -B,
“Hazard Ranking”. Appendix VI-B is adopted. [Eff
] (Auth: HRS 8132-3)(Inp: HRS 8§132-3)

812-45.1-9 Permt authorization. Each county
may, by ordinance, require that a permt be obtained
fromthe chief for any area regulated by this chapter
[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS
§132- 3)

SUBCHAPTER 2
AMENDMENTS TO THE UFC AND THE 1998 AND 1999

SUPPLEMENTS

812-45.1-10 Title. Section 101.1 is anmended to
read: “This code shall be known as the state fire
code, may be cited as such, and will be referred to in
this chapter as this code.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-11 Appeals. Section 103.1.4 is anended
to read: “Each county shall establish, by ordinance, a
county fire appeals board, hereinafter called the
board, as required by section 132-6(f), HRS.”
[ Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-6) (I nmp: HRS §132-3)

45. 1-7



§12-45.1-12

812-45.1-12 General. Section 103.2.1.1 is
anended to read: “The general powers and duties of the
chief are set forth in chapter 132, HRS.”
[ Ef ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Il nmp: HRS §132-
3)

812-45.1-13 Fire prevention bureau personnel and
police. Section 103.2.1.2 is deleted. [Eff
] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3)(lnp: HRS 8132-3

8§12-45.1-14 Authority to inspect. Section

103.3.1.1 is anended to read: “lnspections are
aut hori zed by and shall be nade in accordance with
sections 132-5 and 132-6, HRS.” [Eff ]

(Auth: HRS §§132-3, 132-5, 132-6) (Inp: HRS §§132- 3,
132-5, 132-6)

8§12-45.1-15 Unsafe buildings. The |ast sentence
of section 103.4.5 is anended to read: “See the
applicabl e sections of the building code.” [Eff
] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-16 Investigations. The first paragraph
of section 104.2 is anended to read: “The chief is
authorized to investigate the origin, cause, and
ci rcunst ances of each and every fire occurring in the
county involving loss of life or injury to person or
destruction or damage to property and if deened
necessary the chief is authorized to take i medi ate
charge of all physical evidence relating to the cause
of the fire and to pursue the investigation to its
conclusion.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3)
(I'mp: HRS §132-3)

45.1-8



8§12-45. 1- 20

8§12-45.1-17 Adjuster’s report. Section 104.3.3
is added to read: “Upon the chief’s request, every
conpany or agent transacting the business of fire
insurance in this State shall be required to file with
the chief in each county a nonthly record of fire
| osses paid or incurred on fornms prescribed,
permtted, or furnished by the chief. These forns
shall contain information on each fire | oss such as
the nane of the insured, name of the adjuster, date
and tinme of fire, construction of building or
structure burned, anount of insurance paid, and
apportionment of the | oss where nore than one conpany
insured the risk.

The current National Fire Incident Reporting
System (NFIRS) report forns nay be used.” [Eff

] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-18 Permt required. Section 105.8 is
deleted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'mp: HRS 8§132-3)

812-45.1-19 Definitions and abbreviations.
Section 217-P is anended by adding the foll ow ng
definition to read: “nodified positive al arm sequence
is an automati c sequence that results in an alarm
signal in designated portions of the building or
facility.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'nmp: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-20 Permts and plans. Section 901.2 is
deleted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'mp: HRS §132- 3)

45.1-9



8§12-45.1-21

8§12-45.1-21 Dinensions. The first paragraph of
section 902.2.2.1 is anended to read: “The
unobstructed wi dt h and unobstructed vertical clearance
of a fire apparatus access road shall neet county
requirenents.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS §132-3)
(I'nmp: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45.1-22 Turning radius. Section 902.2.2.3
is amended to read: “The turning radius of a fire
apparatus access road shall neet county requirenents.”
[ Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (lnmp: HRS §132-
3)

8§12-45.1-23 Dead ends. Section 902.2.2.4 is
anended to read: “Dead-end fire apparatus access roads
in excess of 150 feet (45 720 nmm) shall be
provided with approved turn arounds that neet county
requi renents.” [Eff ] (CAut h: HRS 8§132- 3)
(I'np: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45.1-24 Bridges. The first paragraph of
section 902.2.2.5 is anended to read: “Wen a bridge
is required to be used as part of a fire apparatus
access road, the bridge shall be designed for a live
| oad sufficient to carry the inposed |oads of fire
apparatus and shall neet all other county
requi renents.” [Eff ] (CAut h: HRS §132- 3)
(I'np: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45.1-25 Gade. Section 902.2.2.6 is anended
to read: “The gradient for a fire apparatus access
road shall meet county requirenents.” [Eff
] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

45. 1-10



8§12-45. 1- 27

8§12-45.1-26 Required water supply for fire
protection. Section 903.2 is anended to read: “A
wat er supply approved by the county, capabl e of
supplying the required fire flow for fire protection
shall be provided to all prem ses upon which
facilities or buildings, or portions thereof, are
hereafter constructed, or noved into or within the
county. Wen any portion of the facility or building
is in excess of 150 feet (45 720 nmm from a water
supply on a fire apparatus access road, as neasured by
an approved route around the exterior of the facility
or building, on-site fire hydrants and mai ns capabl e
of supplying the required fire flow shall be provided
when required by the chief. For on-site fire hydrant
requi renents see section 903.4 of the UFC

EXCEPTIONS: 1. Wen facilities or buildings, or
portions thereof, are conpletely protected with an
approved automatic fire sprinkler system the
provi sions of section 903.2 may be nodified by the
chi ef.

2. When wat er supply requirenents cannot be
install ed due to topography or other conditions, the
chief may require additional fire protection as
specified in section 1001.9, as anended in this code.

3. When there are not nore than two G oup R
Division 3, or two G oup U QGccupanci es, the
requi renents of section 903.2 may be nodified by the
chief.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8132-3) (Inmp:
HRS §132- 3)

812-45.1-27 Testing and mai ntenance. The second
par agr aph of section 903.4.1.2 is anmended to read:
“The chief shall be notified whenever any fire hydrant
is placed out of service or returned to service.
Owmners of private property required to have hydrants
shall maintain hydrant records of approval, testing,
and mai nt enance, in accordance with the respective
county water requirenents. Records shall be nade
avai l abl e for review by the chief upon request.”

45.1-11



8§12-45. 1- 28

[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-

812-45.1-28 Required installations. The first
paragraph of section 903.4.2 is anended to read: “The
| ocation, nunber and type of fire hydrants connected
to a water supply capable of delivering the required
fire flow shall be provided on a fire apparatus access
road or on the site of the prem ses or both, in
accordance with the appropriate county water
requi renents.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'np: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45.1-29 Installation acceptance testing.
The first paragraph of section 1001.4 is anmended to
read: “Fire alarmsystens; fire hydrant systens; fire-
extingui shing systens; standpipes; and other fire-
protection systens and appurtenances required by this
code shall be approved by the chief as to installation
and | ocation and shall be subject to acceptance tests
required by the appropriate county agency.” [Eff

] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3) (Inp: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45.1-30 Inspection and testing. The third
par agr aph of section 1001.5.2 is anended to read: “A
copy of the systenis inspection and mai nt enance test
report shall be submtted to the chief within five (5)
wor ki ng days after the conpletion of the test. A
witten record shall be maintained on the prem ses and
shall be made available to the chief, upon the chief’s
request.”

Section 1001.5.2 is al so anended by adding a
fourth paragraph to read: “The building or facility
owner shall be responsible for the maintenance of fire
sprinkler systens, private fire hydrant systens,
st andpi pe systens, fire alarmsystens, portable fire

45.1-12



§12-45.1- 33

extingui shers, snoke and heat ventilators, snoke-
renmoval systens and other fire-protection or fire-
extingui shing systens.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS
8132-3) (Inp: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-31 Systens in high-rise buildings.
Section 1001.5.4 is anended to read: “The owner of a
hi gh-rise building shall be responsible for assuring
that the fire- and |ife-safety systens required by the
bui | di ng code are nmintained in an operable condition
at all times. A witten record of the test reports
verifying the operational status of these types of
systens shall be maintained and shall be made
available to the chief, upon request. For high-rise
systens requirenents see UBC section 403 and UFC
section 1007.2.12.2." [Eff ] (Auth: HRS
8132-3) (Inp: HRS 8§132-3)

812-45.1-32 Snoke-control systens. Section
1001.5.5 is anended to read: “Mechanical snoke-contro
systens, such as those in high-rise buildings,
bui |l di ngs containing atria, covered mall buildings and
mechani cal ventilation systens utilized in snokeproof
encl osures and for snoke-renoval systens utilized in
hi gh-pi |l ed conbusti bl e storage occupanci es, shall be
mai ntai ned in an operable condition at all tinmes. A
witten record of the test reports verifying the
operational status of these types of systens shall be
mai nt ai ned and shall be nade available to the chief,
upon request.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'nmp: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-33 Special hazards. The first sentence
of section 1001.9 is anended to read: “For occupancies
of an especially hazardous nature, or where speci al
hazards exist in addition to the nornal hazard of the

45. 1-13



§12-45.1-33

occupancy, or where access for fire apparatus is
unduly difficult, or areas where there is an

i nadequate fire flow, or inadequate fire hydrant
spaci ng, the chief may require additional safeguards
including, but not limted to, additional fire
appliance units, nore than one type of appliance, or
speci al systens suitable for the protection of the
hazard involved.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8§132-
3)(I'np: HRS 8§132-3)

8§12-45.1-34 Ceneral. The third paragraph of
section 1003.1.1 is anended to read: “Fire departnent
hose connections shall be |ocated within 20 feet of a
fire apparatus access road, not |ess than 18 inches
and not nore than 4 feet above grade, or as approved
by the chief. Appropriate identification signs shal
be provided in a |location(s) approved by the chief.”

Section 1003.1.1 is al so anmended by adding a
fifth paragraph to read: “Fire protection equi pnment
and systens shall be installed and nmaintained in
bui | di ngs under construction in accordance with
article 87.”

Section 1003.1.1 is al so anmended by adding a
sixth paragraph to read: “An automatic fire
extingui shing systemshall be installed in the
occupanci es and | ocations as set forth in this
section. \Were an automatic fire extinguishing system
is required, proper types of spare sprinkler heads
shal | be provided and stored in a cabinet in a
| ocati on approved by the chief as follows:

1. 1 to 300 sprinklers 6 heads

2. 301 to 1,000 sprinklers 12 heads

3. Over 1,000 sprinklers 24 heads”

Section 1003.1.1 is al so anmended by adding a
seventh paragraph to read: “In addition, three
sprinkl er stoppers and a special sprinkler wench
shall al so be provided and kept in the cabinet to be
used in the renoval and installation of sprinkler
heads.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np:
HRS §132- 3)

45.1-14



§12-45. 1- 37

8§12-45.1-35 Al occupanci es except Goup R
Division 3 and G oup U occupanci es. The paragraph
nunbered 1 of section 1003.2.2 is anended to read:

“l. In every story or basenent of all buildings
when the floor area exceeds 1,500 square feet and
there is not provided at | east 20 square feet of
opening entirely above the adjoining ground |evel in
each 50 lineal feet or fraction thereof of exterior
wall in the story or basenent on at | east one side of
the building. Each of the required 20 square feet of
openi ng shall have at | east one opening with m ni nrum
di rensions of 3 feet by 4 feet. Such required
openi ngs shall be unobstructed by sunshades, |ouvers,
grillwork, or other construction on the exterior wall
which will prevent or hinder access to the openings by
the fire departnent personnel.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

8§12-45. 1-36 Anusenent buil dings. Section
1003.2.3.6 is anended to read: “An automatic sprinkler
system shall be installed in all pernmanent and
portabl e amusenent buildings. The main water-flow
switch shall be electrically supervised. The
sprinkler main cutoff valve shall be supervised. Wen
t he amusenent building is portable, the sprinkler
wat er - supply system nay be a tenporary type, as
approved by the chief.

EXCEPTI ON: An automatic sprinkler system need
not be provided when the floor area of a portable
anusenent building is less than 1,000 square feet and
the exit travel distance fromany point is |ess than
50 feet.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp:
HRS §132- 3)

812-45.1-37 Goup Moccupancies. Section
1003. 2.8 is anended by adding a second paragraph to
read: “In a one-story building for Goup Mor S
Qccupanci es requiring an automatic sprinkler system a

45. 1-15



§12-45. 1- 37

nmetal plate sign stating the nmaxi num storage hei ght
allowabl e for the installed sprinkler systemshall be
pl aced next to the main shutoff valve of the autonmatic
sprinkler riser.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS
8132-3) (Inmp: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-38 Goup R Dvision 1 occupancies.
Section 1003.2.9 is anended to read: “An automatic
sprinkler systemshall be installed throughout every
apart nent house over one story and containing 17 or
nore dwelling units, every congregate residence over
one story and having an occupant |oad of 50 or nore,
and every hotel over one story and containing 20 or
nore guest roons. Residential or quick-response
standard sprinkler heads shall be used in the dwelling
unit and guest room portions of the building.”
[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (lnmp: HRS
§132- 3)

8§12-45.1-39 Ceneral. The third paragraph of

section 1004.1.1 is anended to read: “Fire departnent
hose connections shall be l[ocated wwthin 20 feet of a
fire apparatus access road, not |ess than 18 inches
and not nore than 4 feet above grade, or as approved
by the chief. Appropriate identification signs shal
be provided as required by the chief.” [Eff

] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

8§12-45.1-40 Required installations. Section
1004.2 is anended to read: “Standpi pe systens shall be
provi ded as set forth in the building code.”
[ Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS
§132- 3)

45. 1-16



8§12-45. 1-43

8§12-45.1-41 Location of Cass | standpi pe hose
connections. The third paragraph of section 1004.3 is
anended to read: “There shall be at |east one two-way,
2 Y2inch outlet above the roof |ine when the roof has
a slope of less than 4 units vertical in 12 units
hori zontal (33.3% sl ope).”

The fourth paragraph of section 1004.3 is
anended to read: “In buildings where nore than one
standpi pe is provided, the standpi pes shall be
i nterconnected at the bottom Control (isolation)
val ves shall be provided for each riser in a |ocation
approved by the chief. The control valves shall be
installed not nore than 4 feet and not |less than 2
feet above floor |evel and shall be secured in the
open position by |locking or sealing the valve.” [Eff

] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inmp: HRS 8132-

3)

8§12-45.1-42 Location of Cass Il standpi pe hose
connections. The third paragraph of section 1004.5 is
anended to read: “In buildings where nore than one

standpi pe is provided, the standpi pes shall be

i nterconnected at the bottom Control (isolation)

val ves shall be provided for each riser in a |location
approved by the chief. The control valves shall be
installed not nore than 4 feet and not |less than 2
feet above floor |evel and shall be secured in the
open position by |locking or sealing the valve.”

[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (lnmp: HRS
8§132- 3)

812-45.1-43 C(Operations and nai ntenance. The
fourth paragraph of section 1006.2.8 is anended to
read: “Extinguishing systens shall be serviced at
| east every six nmonths or after activation of the
system |Inspections shall be conducted by a qualified
i ndi vi dual as approved by the chief. A copy of the
i nspection test report shall be kept on the prem ses

45. 1-17



8§12-45. 1-43

and a copy of the inspection report shall be forwarded
to the chief within five (5) working days of
conpletion of the required servicing and testing.”

Section 1006.2.8 is al so anended by adding a sixth
paragraph to read: “The chief shall be notified a
m ni mrum of four (4) working days prior to the service
date by the conpany conducting the test. The chi ef
shall be inforned of the nane of the business being
serviced, date and tine of servicing, and the conpany
and the individual conducting the servicing.” [Eff

] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS §132-3)

8§12-45.1-44 Ceneral. Section 1007.2.4.1 is
anended by adding a second paragraph to read: “Fire
al arm systens shall be tested and | ogged nonthly.”
Section 1007.2.4.1 is al so anended by adding a
third paragraph to read: “An annunci ator panel shal
be provided in the office of each school.” [Eff
] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-45 Ceneral. Section 1007.2.9.1.1 is
anmended by del eting exception nunber 2. [Eff
] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45.1-46 Existing Group R occupanci es.
Section 1007.2.9.2 is deleted. [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (lnmp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-47 Fire department communication
system Section 1007.2.12.2.4 is anended to read: “A
two-way, fire departnment communication system approved
by the chief shall be provided for fire departnent
use. A jack or plug receptacle shall be |ocated at
the follow ng | ocations:

45.1-18



8§12-45. 1-48

1. The central control station or the central
| ocati on approved by the chief.
2. The designated fire service elevator(s).
3. Each el evator |obby on each floor of the
bui | di ng.
4. Enmergency and standby power roons.
5. The stairwell side of each exit into each
required stairway.
The hei ght of the jack or plug receptacl e shal
be not nore than 5 feet and not |ess than 3 feet above
floor level. Portable hand sets in conpliance with
the foll ow ng provisions shall be provided by the
bui | di ng owner or managenent for fire departnment use:
1. Not less than 10 approved-type portabl e hand
sets shall be stored and maintained in the
central control station
2. Length of cord for portable hand sets shall be
provi ded as reconmended and approved by the
chi ef .
3. Hand sets approved by the chief shall be
mai ntai ned in an operative condition at all tines
and shall be replaced or repaired when found to
be defective.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS
8132-3) (Inp: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-48 Central control station. Section
1007.2.12.2.5 is added to read: “A central control
station roomfor fire departnment operations shall be
provi ded. The | ocation and accessibility of the
central control station room shall be approved by the
chief. The roomshall be accessible fromthe exterior
of the building. The central control station room
shall be separated fromthe remai nder of the building
by not |ess than a one-hour fire-resistive occupancy
separation. The roomshall be a mninmumof 96 (9 mf)
square feet with a mninum di nension of 8 feet (2438

nmm. It shall contain the following as a m ni num
1. The voice alarmand public address system
panel s.

2. The fire departnent comrunications panel.

45.1-19



8§12-45. 1-48

3. Fire-detection and al arm syst em annunci at or

panel s.

4. Annunciator visually indicating the |ocation

of the elevators and whether they are

operational .

5. Status indicators and controls for air

handl i ng systens.

6. Controls for unlocking all stairway doors

si mul t aneousl y.

7. Sprinkler valve and water-fl ow detector

di spl ay panels.

8. Enmergency and standby power status indicators.

9. A telephone for fire departnment use with

controll ed access to the public tel ephone system

10. Fire punp status indicators.

11. Schematic building plans indicating the

typical floor plan and detailing the building

core, neans of egress, fire-protection systens,
firefighting equi pnment and fire departnent
access.

12. Wrk table.

Control panels in the central control station
shall be permanently identified as to function.

Al arm supervisory and trouble signals as
required by Itenms 3 and 7 above shall be annunci ated
in conpliance with the fire code in the central
control station by neans of an audi bl e and vi sual
indicator.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'np: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-49 Manual fire alarm boxes. Nunber 1
of section 1007.3.3.1 is anended to read: “1. At every

required exit fromevery level.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-50 Annunci ator panel. Section
1007.3.3.2.1 is added to read: “An annunci ator panel
shall be provided on the first floor |obby area or
ot her areas designated by the chief in any new fire

45. 1- 20



§12-45. 1-52

alarminstallation for buildings four stories or
nore.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8132-3) (I np:
HRS §132- 3)

8§12-45.1-51 Ceneral. Section 1007.3.3.3.1 s
anended by nunbering the exception as nunber 1 and by
addi ng a second exception to read:

“EXCEPTION: 2. Modified positive al arm sequence
when approved by the chief.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

8§12-45.1-52 Fire alarmsystem nodified positive
al arm sequence. Section 1007.3.3.3.1.1 is added to
read: “Buildings or facilities shall neet all of the
following requirenents for a positive al arm sequence:
1. An automatic fire sprinkler systeminstalled
in conformance with the building code shall be
provi ded t hroughout the building or facility.
2. Witten fire emergency procedures and an
evacuation plan for the building or facility
shall be reviewed by the chief prior to approval
testing. The procedures and plan shall include,
but not be Ilimted to, imediate notification to
the fire departnent, use of primary and secondary
exits, use of fire protection appliances for the
bui l ding(s) or facility(ies).
3. Trained personnel shall respond to energencies
on a 24-hour basis. The staff shall be
instructed in fire enmergency procedures and the
use and operation of in-house fire appliances.
Docunent ati on of such training shall be
mai ntai ned and filed on the prem ses.
4. 1mrediate notification of the fire departnent
shal | take place upon activation of any fire
alarminitiating device.
5. If an initiating device of the fire alarm
systemis activated, acknow edgenent at the
control unit by trained personnel shall be

45.1-21



§12-45. 1-52

acconplished within 15 seconds in order to
initiate the alarminvestigation phase. |If the
signal is not acknow edged within 15 seconds, al
building or facility and renote signals shall be
activated imedi ately and automatically (general
alarm.

6. If an initiating device of the fire alarm
systemis activated, all notification devices in
t hat zone shall be activated. The zone
notification shall include the floor of, the

fl oor above and the floor below the activated
device. The zone notification areas my be
nodified with the approval of the chief. This
zone notification shall be for a maxi num of three
(3) mnutes, during which trained personnel shal
initiate the alarminvestigati on phase,

comuni cate their findings i mediately to the
fire departnent, and reset the systemif
appropriate. After three (3) mnutes, or an
activation of any other initiating device(s), the
fire alarmsystem shall be activated i medi ately
and automatically for the entire building or
facility (general alarm. At no tinme shall the
fire alarmsystem be silenced until verification
of the alarmis acconpli shed.

7. The fire alarmsystem shall provide a nmeans to
bypass the positive al arm sequence and

i mredi ately activate the general alarmfor the
entire building or facility.

8. The chief shall conduct a test of the positive
al arm sequence prior to inplenentation.

9. The chief may di sapprove or rescind approval
of the positive alarm sequence of the fire alarm
systemif all of the above requirenents are not
met and shall require the fire alarmsystemto be
reprogrammed to neet a general alarmnotification
at the owners expense.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

45. 1- 22



§12-45. 1-56

8§12-45.1-53 Audibility. Section 1007.3.3.3.3 is
anended to read: “The alarmsignal shall be a
di stinctive sound, which is not used for any other
pur pose other than the fire alarm Al armsignaling
devi ces shall produce a sound that exceeds the
prevailing equival ent sound | evel in the roomor space
by 15 deci bels m ninmum or exceeds any maxi mum sound
| evel with a duration of 60 seconds m ninumby 5
deci bel s m ni rum whichever is louder. Sound |evels
for alarmsignals shall be 120 deci bel s maxi mum”
[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inmp: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45.1-54 Permts and plans. Section 1101.3
is deleted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'mp: HRS §132- 3)

812-45.1-55 Incinerators. Section 1102.2 is
deleted. [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8132-3) (I np:
HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-56 General. Section 1102.3.1 is
anended to read: “Control of the followng fires shal
be established by each county:

1. Fires for cooking of food.

2. Fires for recreational, decorative, or

cerenoni al purposes.

3. Fires to abate a fire hazard.

4. Fires for prevention or control of disease or

pests.

5. Fires for training of fire fighting personnel.

6. Fires for disposal of dangerous materials.

7. Fires for residential bathing purposes.
Except for closed incinerators approved by the
state health departnent, private incineration is
prohi bited by state health | aws. C earance by the
state health departnent for and notification of al
agricultural fires either by tel ephone or witten
notice shall be on file with the chief before these

45. 1- 23



§12-45. 1-56

fires are permtted.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS
8132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-3)

8§12-45.1-57 Material restrictions. Section
1102.3.3 is deleted. [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS
8132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-3)

812-45.1-58 Nonnetallic containers. Section
1103.2.1.4.2 is anended by addi ng an exception to
read: “EXCEPTION:. Containers used by private
resi dences for refuse pickup.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-59 Textile and filmnmaterials. The
| ast sentence of section 1103.3.3.2 is anended to
read: “See article 90, section 9003, standard n.2.6.”
[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS 8132-
3)

812-45.1-60 Wod. The |ast sentence of section
1103.3.3.3 is anended to read: “See article 90,
section 9003, standard n.2.7.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

8§12-45.1-61 Foam plastics. Section 1103.3.3.4
is amended to read: “Foam plastics and materials
contai ning foam plastics shall be in accordance with
the foll ow ng:

1. Exhibit booth construction shall have a

maxi mum heat-rel ease rate of 100 kil owatts when

tested in accordance with nationally recognized

standards. See article 90, section 9003,

45. 1- 24



§12-45. 1- 64

standard u. 1. 16.

2. Decorative objects including but not limted
to mannequi ns, nurals and signs, shall have a
maxi num heat -rel ease rate of 150 kil owatts when
tested in accordance with nationally recognized
standards. See article 90, section 9003,
standard u. 1. 16.

EXCEPTI ON: When the aggregate area of nurals,
signs or simlar decorative objects occupies |ess
than 10 percent of the floor or wall area, this
requi renent may be waived by the chief.

3. Theater, notion picture and tel evision stage
settings with or without horizontal projections
and sinmul ated caves or caverns shall have a
maxi num heat -rel ease rate of 100 kil owatts when
tested in accordance with nationally recognized
standards. See article 90, section 9003,
standard u.1.16.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS
8132-3) (Inmp: HRS 8132-3)

812-45.1-62 Parade floats. Section 1104 is
del eted. [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8132-3) (I mp:
HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-63 No snoking signs. Section
1109.4.1.1 is added to read: “The size, color and
| ocation of legally required no snoking signs shall be
subject to the approval of the chief. Lettering shal
be at | east 4-inches high with “»inch stroke.” [Eff
] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-64 Theatrical performances. Section
1109.8.4 is anended by adding a second sentence to
read: “For requirenents and exceptions see section
2501. 17, ‘Candles and other open-flanme devices’ as
anended in this code.” [Eff ] (Aut h:
HRS 8§132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-3)

45. 1-25



§12-45. 1-65

812-45.1-65 ldentification. Section 1111.2.3 is
anended to read: “Wen required by the chief, a sign
shal | be di splayed permanently near or on each
required fire door in letters not less than 1 inch
(25.4 mm) high to read as follows:

FI RE DOOR
DO NOT OBSTRUCT
or
FI RE DOOR
KEEP CLOSED’
[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-

812-45.1-66 Additional doors. Section 1207.7
i s anended by addi ng an exception to read:

“EXCEPTI ON: Doubl e-acting screen doors used in
conjunction with exit doors having panic hardware in
school cafetoriunms.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS
8132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-3)

812-45.1-67 Latch. Section 1208.2 is anmended by
nunbering the exception as nunber 1 and by adding a
second exception to read:

“EXCEPTIONS: 2. In accordance with the building
code, security gates may be permtted across corridors
or passageways in school buildings if there is a
readily visible durable sign on or adjacent to the
gate, stating ‘THIS GATE IS TO REMAIN SECURED I N THE
OPEN POSI TI ON WHENEVER THI'S BUILDING IS IN USE' . The
sign shall be in letters not | ess than one inch high
on a contrasting background. The use of this
exception may be revoked by the building official for
due cause.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-
3)(I'np: HRS 8§132-3)

45. 1- 26



8§12-45.1-71

812-45.1-68 Elevator identification. Section
1214 is added to read: “At all elevator |ocations on
each floor |evel above and bel ow the floor of exit
di scharge, there shall be displayed in a conspicuous
| ocation a sign reading: ‘IN CASE OF FIRE USE EXIT
STAI RWAYS. DO NOT USE ELEVATORS . Lettering shall be
not | ess than 5/8-inch high.

EXCEPTI ON: Signs at |east 2-3/4-inches X 2-1/4-
inches in overall size with |egible wording and
approved by the chief, may be used as an alternate and
shall be affixed at each el evator call button
assenbl y.

El evat or service conpani es shall have their name
and tel ephone nunber in the el evator key box.” [Eff

] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-69 Fire drills. Section 1303.3.3.2 1is
anended by nunbering the exception as nunber 1 and
addi ng a second exception to read:

“EXCEPTION: 2. Fire drills at high schools, mddle
school s and internedi ate schools shall be conducted at
| east quarterly during school sessions.” [Eff

] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-
3)

8§12-45.1-70 Permts. Section 2401.2 renunbered
as section 2401.3 in the 1999 Suppl enent is del eted.
[ Eff ] Aut h: HRS 8§132-3) (Inmp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-71 Permts and plans. Section 2501.3
is deleted. [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8§132-
3) (I mp: HRS §132-3)

45. 1- 27



§12-45.1-72

812-45.1-72 Decorative materials. Section
2501.5 is anended by adding a second sentence to read:
“Arecord of fire-resistant treatnent shall be kept on
the prem ses for review by the chief.” [Eff
] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-73 Plan of exit ways and ai sl es.
Section 2501.14 is anended to read: “A floor plan
i ndicating the seating arrangenents, |ocation and
wi dth of exit ways and aisles shall be submtted to
the chief for review for places of assenbly with an
occupant | oad of 300 or nore persons. A copy of the
pl an shall be kept on display on the prem ses.

An exit plan shall also be posted in a
conspi cuous |l ocation near the main entrance and shal
be maintained in a legible condition by the owner or
an aut horized agent.

Managenent of the event or business shall be
responsi bl e for the inspection before each show or
event of all required neans of egress fromeach part
of the building, including stairways, egress doors and
any panic hardware installed thereon, aisles and
corridors. Passageways and simlar elenents of the
means of egress shall be available for imredi ate use
and free of all obstructions before each show or
event. Mnagenent shall informall patrons of al
required exit |ocations before each show or event in
pl aces of assenbly with an occupant | oad of 300 or
nore persons.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-
3)(I'nmp: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45.1-74 Determ nation of occupant | oad.
Section 2501.16.2 is anended to read: “The nunber of
persons in a building or portion thereof shall not
exceed the anounts determ ned as specified in the
bui l di ng code.” [Eff ] (Auth: HRS
8132-3) (Inmp: HRS 8132-3)

45. 1- 28



8§12-45. 1-77

812-45.1-75 Candl es and ot her open-fl ane
devices. Section 2501.17 is anended by adding a
fourth exception to read:

“EXCEPTI ON: 4. \When approved by the chief, open-
fl ame devices nay be used on stages or platforns,
provi ded adequate precautions are taken to prevent
ignition of conbustible materials. So-called flam ng
sword or other |ike equipnent shall not be used except
in areas protected by an automatic sprinkler system
This shall be construed to nean that stages,
pl atforns, dressing and storage roons or areas used as
pl aces for the performance of flam ng sword or other
dance performances using fire or flame, shall be

sprinklered. In addition, a suitable non-conbustible
net shall be erected to prevent accidental release
onto the view ng audi ence.” [Eff ]

(Auth: HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

8§12-45.1-76 Portable heating equi pnent. Section
2501.17.1 is added to read: “Portabl e heating
equi pnent, not flue-connected, shall be permtted only
as follows: Equiprnent fueled by small heat sources
whi ch can be readily extinguished by water, such as
candl es or al cohol -burni ng equi pnent (including solid
al cohol ) may be used provi ded adequat e precautions
satisfactory to the chief are taken to prevent
ignition of any conbustible materials.

No person shall use or allow to be used any open
fl ame device or burning candle or candles in any
buil ding or place in such a manner as to create a fire
hazard.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8132-3) (I mp:
HRS §132- 3)

812-45.1-77 Permts. Section 2703 is del eted.
[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-
3)

45. 1- 29



8§12-45.1-78

§12-45.1-78 Pernits.
[ Ef f
§132- 3)

§12-45.1-79 Permits.
[ Ef f ] (Aut h:

3)

§12-45.1-80 Permits.
[ Ef f ] (Aut h:

3)

8§12-45.1-81 Scope.
read:
2100 square feet shal

§132-3) (1 np: HRS §132- 3)

812-45.1-82 Permts.
[ Ef f ] (Aut h:

3)

812-45.1-83 Permts.
[ Ef f ] (Aut h:

§132- 3)

§12-45.1-84 Pernits.
[ Ef f
§132- 3)

] (Aut h:

] (Aut h:

Section 2803 is del et ed.
HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS

Section 2901.2 is del eted.
HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS §132-

Section 3003 is del eted.
HRS 8§132-3) (I np: HRS §132-

Section 3201 is anmended to
“Tents and canopi es having an area in excess of
conply with article 32.
Tenpor ary nenbrane structures shal
county building code.” [Eff

conply with the
] (Aut h: HRS

Section 3203 is del et ed.
HRS §132-3) (I np: HRS §132-

Section 3302 is del eted.
HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS

Section 3403 is del eted.
HRS §132-3) (I np: HRS

45. 1- 30



§12- 45. 1- 85
[ Ef f
§132- 3)

Permts.
] (Aut h:

§12- 45. 1- 86
[ Ef f
§132- 3)

Permts.
] (Aut h:

§12- 45. 1- 87
[ Ef f
§132- 3)

Permts.
] (Aut h:

§12- 45. 1- 88
[ Ef f
3)

Permts.
] (Aut h:

8§12-45.1-89 Fumi gation and thernal
Article 47 is del eted.
HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS 8§132-3)

f oggi ng.
(Aut h:

812-45.1-90 Permts.
[ Ef ] (Aut h:

3)

812-45.1-91 Permts.
[ Ef ] (Aut h:

3)

8§12-45.1-91

Section 3503 is del eted.
HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS

Section 3601.3 is del eted.
HRS §132-3) (Inmp: HRS

Section 4501.3 i s del eted.
HRS §132-3) (Inmp: HRS

Section 4602 is del et ed.
HRS 8§132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-

i nsectici de
[ Ef f ]

Section 4802 is del et ed.
HRS §132-3) (I np: HRS §132-

Section 4901.3 is del et ed.
HRS §132-3) (I np: HRS §132-

45.1-31



§12-45. 1-92

§12- 45. 1- 92
[ Ef f
3)

§12-45.1-93

§12-45. 1-94
is deleted. [Eff

Permts.
] (Aut h:

Permts.
] (Aut h:

Permts

3) (I np: HRS §132-3)

§12- 45. 1- 95
[ Ef f
3)

8§12-45. 1- 96
deleted. [Eff
HRS §132- 3)

8§12-45.1-97
deleted. [Eff
HRS §132- 3)

§12- 45, 1- 98
[ Ef f
3)

Permts.
] (Aut h:

Permts

Permts

Permts.
] (Aut h:

45. 1-32

and pl ans.
] (Aut h: HRS 8§132-

and pl ans.

and pl ans.

Section 5003 is del eted.
HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS 8§132-

Section 5101.5 is del eted.
HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS 8§132-

Section 5201.3

Section 6103 is del eted.
HRS 8§132-3) (I np: HRS §132-

Section 6202 is
HRS §132-3) (I np:

Section 6304 is
HRS §132-3) (I np:

Section 6403 is del et ed.
HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS 8§132-



§12-45.1-103

812-45.1-99 Permts. Section 7401.3 is del eted.
[ Ef ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS 8132-
3)

812-45.1-100 Permts. Section 7501.3 is
del eted. [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8132-3) (I mp:
HRS §132-3)

8§12-45.1-101 Tank vehicles. Section 7503.4.2.1
is added to read: “Tank vehicles transporting
cryogenic fluids shall not be left unattended on any
residential street or wiwthin 500 feet of any
residential area, apartnent or hotel conplex,
educational, hospital or care facility at any tinme; or
at any other place or location that woul d present a
hazard to persons or property fromfire | oss.

EXCEPTI ON: When unattendance i s necessary in
connection with unloading the vehicle or servicing
tanks; or when in case of accident or other energency,
the operator nust |eave the vehicle to obtain
assi stance.” [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8§132-
3)(Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-102 Permts. Section 7601.3 is
del eted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp:
HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-103 Explosive materials. Article 77 is
anended by only adopting section 7702 of article 77.
[ Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-
3)

45. 1-33



8§12-45.1-104

812-45.1-104 Permts. Section 7801.3, of the
1999 Supplenent is deleted. [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS 8§132-3)

8§12-45. 1-105 Sei zure of fireworks. Section
7802.2 of the 1999 Supplenent is anended to read: “The
chief is authorized to require the owner to renove at
t he expense of the owner, all fireworks offered for
sale, stored, or possessed in violation of article 78,
or other applicable state or county laws or rules.”

[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Il nmp: HRS §132-
3)

8§12-45.1-106 Prohibition. Exception nunber 1 of
section 7802.3 of the 1999 Suppl enent is del et ed.
Exception nunber 4 of section 7802.3 of the UFC, 1999
Suppl enent, is anended to read: “lnportation, storage,
possessi on, sale, purchase, transfer and di scharge of
fireworks, shall be in accordance with chapter 132D
HRS. " [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp:
HRS §132- 3)

12-45.1-107 GCeneral. Section 7802.4.1 of the
1999 Suppl enent is anended by deleting the |ast
sentence. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'mp: HRS §132-3)

8§12-45.1-108 Display of firewrks for retai
sales. Section 7804 is added to the 1999 Suppl enent
to read: “The display of fireworks designated by the
United States Departnent of Transportation as UN 0336
1.4G for retail sales shall be in accordance with the
fol | ow ng:

1. Displays accessible to the public shall not

45.1- 34



8§12-45.1-111

exceed 2% of the total square footage of the
sales area of the store.

EXCEPTI ON: Retail stores or booths used
exclusively for the sale of firewrks may exceed
2% but shall not exceed 25%

2. The location of displays shall not render any

required exit unusable or that will present a

hazar dous conditi on.

3. Displays shall not exceed 6 feet above the

finished floor.

4. Display areas shall be separated from sources

of heat or ignition by a mininum4 feet.

5. Aclear aisle width of 44 inches shall be

mai nt ai ned.

6. Unless otherw se prohibited by county

ordi nance, no snoking signs shall be provided on

al | approachabl e sides of the display.

7. A mninmmof two (2) 2A10BC portable fire

extingui shers within 75 feet travel distance

shall be provided.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-109 Permts and plans. Section 7901.3
is deleted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS §132-3)
(I'np: HRS 8§132-3)

812-45.1-110 GCeneral. Section 7901.9.1 is
anended by addi ng a second sentence to read: “In
addition to the sign style identified in section
7901.9. 2, placards shall be nounted or affixed in
accordance wth article 90, section 9002, UFC Standard
79-3." [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (I np: HRS
8§132-3)

8§12-45.1-111 Label or placard. The first
par agraph of section 7902.1.3.2 is anended to read:

45. 1-35



8§12-45.1-111

“Tanks over 60 gallons in capacity permanently
installed or nounted and used for the storage of C ass
I, 1l or III-Aliquids shall bear a |abel or placard
identifying the material therein in accordance with
article 90, section 9002, UFC Standard 79-3.”

[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3)(lnp: HRS
§132- 3)

812-45.1-112 Tanks abandoned in place. Section
7902.1.7.2.4 is anended to read: “Tanks nay be
abandoned in place only if a certified structural
engi neer confirms that the renoval of the tank wll
j eopardi ze the structural integrity of the existing
building. An affidavit attesting to this
determ nation shall be submtted to the chief prior to
t aki ng abandonment neasures. Tanks abandoned in pl ace
shal | be abandoned as foll ows:
1. Flammabl e and conbustible |iquids shall be
removed fromthe tank and connected piping,
2. The suction, inlet, gage, vapor return and
vapor |ines shall be disconnected,
3. The tank shall be filled conpletely with an
approved, inert solid material,
4. Renai ni ng underground pi ping shall be capped
or plugged, and
5. Arecord of tank size, location and date of
abandonnment shall be retained by the owner and a
copy submtted to the chief.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3)(lnp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-113 GCeneral. Section 8001.3.1 is
anended to read: “Permts are not required.”
[ Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-
3)

45. 1- 36



§12-45.1-117

8§12-45. 1- 114 Hazardous naterial s managenent
pl an. The first sentence of section 8001.3.2 is
anended to read: “Wen required by the chief, the
owner of buildings or facilities shall have a
hazar dous material s managenent plan (HWW) posted on
site. An exanple of a HMW can be found in UFC
Appendi x II1-E.”

The second sentence of section 8001.3.2 is
deleted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3)
(I'np: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45. 1- 115 Hazardous materials inventory
statenent. The first sentence of section 8001.3.3 is
anended to read: “Wen required by the chief, a
hazardous materials inventory statenment (HM S) shal
be made a part of the hazardous materials nanagenent
plan. An exanple of a HM S can be found in UFC
Appendi x I1-E "7 [Eff ] (CAut h: HRS §132- 3)
(I'mp: HRS 8§132-3)

812-45.1-116 Protection fromvehicles. The
paragraph nunbered 2 of section 8001.11.3 is anended
to read:

“2. Spaced not nore than 3 feet (914 mm) between

posts on center,”

The paragraph nunbered 5 of section 8001.11.3 is
anmended to read:

“5. Located not less than 3 feet (914 nm from

the tank.” [Eff ] (CAut h: HRS 8§132- 3)
(I'np: HRS 8§132-3)

8§12-45.1-117 Permits and plan submttal. Section
8101.3 is deleted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS
8§132-3) (Inmp: HRS 8§132-3)

45. 1- 37



8§12-45.1-118

§12-45.1-118 PERM TS, PLANS AND RECORDS.
Section 8202 is deleted. [Eff ] (Auth:
HRS §132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-119 Ceneral. Section 8203.1 is anended
by addi ng a second paragraph to read: “Hazard
i dentification signage shall be provided and affi xed
to all approachabl e sides of the tank or tank
encl osure in conformance with article 90, section
9002, UFC Standard 79-3.” [Eff ] (Auth:
HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-120 Permts. Section 8702 is del eted.
[ Ef f ] (Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-121 Asbestos renpval. Section 8707 is
deleted. [Eff ] (Aut h: HRS 8132-3) (I np:
HRS §132-3)

812-45.1-122 Permts. Section 8801.3 is
del eted. [Eff ] (Auth: HRS 8§132-3)
(I'nmp: HRS 8132-3)

8§12-45. 1-123 Recogni zed standards. Section 9003
i s amended by addi ng a new standard to read:
“a.7. AMERI CAN SOCI ETY OF HEATI NG REFRI GERATI ON AND
Al R- CONDI TI ONI NG ENG NEERS
1791 Tullie Circle, NE, Atlanta, GA 30329
ANSI / ASHRAE St andard 15-1994, Safety Code for
Mechani cal Refrigeration.” [Eff ]
(Auth: HRS 8132-3) (Inp: HRS §132-3)

45. 1- 38



