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is a member of the boards of directors 
of CTI and People’s Choice, she will 
have certain veto rights. 

Under 49 U.S.C. 14303(b), the Board 
must approve and authorize a 
transaction found to be consistent with 
the public interest, taking into 
consideration at least: (1) the effect of 
the transaction on the adequacy of 
transportation to the public; (2) the total 
fixed charges that result; and (3) the 
interest of affected carrier employees. 

CTI has submitted information, as 
required by 49 CFR 1182.2, including 
the information to demonstrate that the 
proposed transaction is consistent with 
the public interest under 49 U.S.C. 
14303(b). CTI states that the proposed 
transaction will have no impact on the 
adequacy of transportation services 
available to the public, that fixed 
charges associated with the proposed 
transaction will not be adversely 
impacted and that the interests of 
employees of People’s Choice will not 
be adversely impacted. Additional 
information, including a copy of the 
application, may be obtained from CTI’s 
representative. 

On the basis of the application, we 
find that the proposed acquisition of 
control and lease of operating authority 
is consistent with the public interest 
and should be authorized. If any 
opposing comments are timely filed, 
this finding will be deemed vacated, 
and unless a final decision can be made 
on the record as developed, a 
procedural schedule will be adopted to 
reconsider the application. See 49 CFR 
1182.6(c). If no opposing comments are 
filed by the expiration of the comment 
period, this notice will take effect 
automatically and will be the final 
Board action. 

Board decisions and notices are 
available on our Web site at http://
www.stb.dot.gov. 

This decision will not significantly 
affect either the quality of the human 
environment or the conservation of 
energy resources. 

It is ordered: 
1. The proposed finance transaction is 

approved and authorized, subject to the 
filing of opposing comments. 

2. If timely opposing comments are 
filed, the findings made in this notice 
will be deemed as having been vacated. 

3. This notice will be effective August 
22, 2005, unless timely comments are 
filed. 

4. A copy of this notice will be served 
on: (1) the U.S. Department of 
Transportation, Federal Motor Carrier 
Safety Administration, 400 7th Street, 
SW., Room 8214, Washington, DC 
20590; (2) the U.S. Department of 
Justice, Antitrust Division, 10th Street & 

Pennsylvania Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC 20530; and (3) the U.S. 
Department of Transportation, Office of 
the General Counsel, 400 7th Street, 
SW., Washington, DC 20590.

Decided: June 30, 2005.
By the Board, Chairman Nober, Vice 

Chairman Buttrey, and Commissioner 
Mulvey. 
Vernon A. Williams, 
Secretary.
[FR Doc. 05–13438 Filed 7–7–05; 8:45 am] 
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DEPARTMENT OF THE TREASURY

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

June 29, 2005. 
The Department of Treasury has 

submitted the following public 
information collection requirement(s) to 
OMB for review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Copies of the 
submission(s) may be obtained by 
calling the Treasury Bureau Clearance 
Officer listed. Comments regarding this 
information collection should be 
addressed to the OMB reviewer listed 
and to the Treasury Department 
Clearance Officer, Department of the 
Treasury, Room 11000, 1750 
Pennsylvania Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC 20220. 

Dates: Written comments should be 
received on or before August 8, 2005 to 
be assured of consideration. 

Internal Revenue Service (IRS) 
OMB Number: 1545–1139. 
Regulation Project Number: PS–264–

82 Final. 
Type of Review: Extension. 
Title: Adjustments to Basis of Stock 

and Indebtedness to Shareholders of S 
Corporations and Treatment of 
Distributions by S Corporations to 
Shareholders. 

Description: The regulations provide 
the procedures and the statements to be 
filed by S corporations for making the 
election provided under section 1368, 
and by shareholders who choose to 
reorder items that decrease their basis. 
Statements required to be filled will be 
used to verify that taxpayers are 
complying with the requirements 
imposed by Congress. 

Respondents: Business and other for-
profit, Individuals or households. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
2,000. 

Estimated Burden Hours Respondent: 
6 minutes. 

Frequency of Response: On occasion, 
Annually. 

Estimated Total Reporting Burden: 
200 hours.

OMB Number: 1545–1491. 
Regulation Project Number: REG–

209798–95 Final. 
Type of Review: Extension. 
Title: Amortizable Bond Premium. 
Description: The information 

requested is necessary for the Service to 
determine whether a holder of a bond 
has elected to amortize bond premium 
and to determine whether an issuer or 
a holder has changed its method of 
accounting for premium. 

Respondents: Individuals or 
households. Business and other for-
profit. 

Estimated Number of Respondents: 
10,000. 

Estimated Burden Hours Respondent: 
29 minutes. 

Frequency of Response: Other (once). 
Estimated Total Reporting Burden: 

7,500 hours. 
Clearance Officer: Glenn P. Kirkland 

(202) 622–3428, Internal Revenue 
Service, Room 6516, 1111 Constitution 
Avenue, NW., Washington, DC 20224. 

OMB Reviewer: Alexander T. Hunt 
(202) 395–7316, Office of Management 
and Budget, Room 10235, New 
Executive Office Building, Washington, 
DC 20503.

Lois K. Holland, 
Treasury PRA Clearance Officer.
[FR Doc. 05–13440 Filed 7–7–05; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 4830–01–P

DEPARTMENT OF THE TREASURY

Submission for OMB Review; 
Comment Request 

June 30, 2005. 
The Department of Treasury has 

submitted the following public 
information collection requirement(s) to 
OMB for review and clearance under the 
Paperwork Reduction Act of 1995, 
Public Law 104–13. Copies of the 
submission(s) may be obtained by 
calling the Treasury Bureau Clearance 
Officer listed. Comments regarding this 
information collection should be 
addressed to the OMB reviewer listed 
and to the Treasury Department 
Clearance Officer, Department of the 
Treasury, Room 11000, 1750 
Pennsylvania Avenue, NW., 
Washington, DC 20220. 

Dates: Written comments should be 
received on or before August 8, 2005 to 
be assured of consideration. 

Internal Revenue Service (IRS) 

OMB Number: 1545–0014. 
Form Number: IRS Form 637. 
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