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advisor with the information required 
by 222.101–3–70(b). If the labor advisor is 
unsuccessful in obtaining concurrence 
of the parties for the movement of the 
material and further action to obtain 
the material is deemed necessary, refer 
the matter to the agency head. Upon 
review and verification that the items 
are urgently or critically needed and 
cannot be moved with the consent of 
the parties, the agency head, on a non-
delegable basis, may order removal of 
the items from the facility.

222.101–70 Acquisition of stevedoring 
services during labor disputes. 

(a) Use the following procedures only 
in the order listed when a labor dispute 
delays performance of a contract for 
stevedoring services which are ur-
gently needed. 

(1) Attempt to have management and 
labor voluntarily agree to exempt mili-
tary supplies from the labor dispute by 
continuing the movement of such ma-
terial. 

(2) Divert vessels to alternate ports 
able to provide necessary stevedoring 
services. 

(3) Consider contracting with reliable 
alternative sources of supply within 
the stevedoring industry. 

(4) Utilize civil service stevedores to 
perform the work performed by con-
tract stevedores. 

(5) Utilize military personnel to han-
dle the cargo which was being handled 
by contract stevedores prior to the 
labor dispute. 

(b) Notify the labor advisor when a 
deviation from the procedures in para-
graph (a) of this subsection is required.

222.102 Federal and State labor re-
quirements.

222.102–1 Policy. 
(1) The Department of Labor is re-

sponsible for the administration and 
enforcement of the Occupational Safe-
ty and Health Act (OSHA). Contracting 
officers shall— 

(i) Direct all inquiries from contrac-
tors or contractor employees regarding 
the applicability or interpretation of 
the OSHA regulations to the Depart-
ment of Labor; and 

(ii) Upon request, provide the address 
of the appropriate field office of the Oc-

cupational Safety and Health Adminis-
tration of the Department of Labor. 

(2) Do not initiate any application for 
the suspension or relaxation of labor 
requirements without prior coordina-
tion with the labor advisor.

222.103 Overtime.

222.103–4 Approvals. 

(a) The department/agency approving 
official shall— 

(i) Obtain the concurrence of other 
appropriate approving officials; and 

(ii) Seek agreement as to the con-
tracts under which overtime premiums 
will be approved when— 

(A) Two or more contracting offices 
have current contracts at the same 
contractor facility; and 

(B) The approval of overtime by one 
contracting office will affect the per-
formance or cost of contracts of an-
other office. In the absence of evidence 
to the contrary, a contracting officer 
may rely on a contractor’s statement 
that approval of overtime premium pay 
for one contract will not affect per-
formance or payments under any other 
contract.

Subpart 222.3—Contract Work 
Hours and Safety Standards Act

222.302 Liquidated damages and over-
time pay. 

Upon receipt of notification of Con-
tract Work Hours and Safety Stand-
ards Act violations, the contracting of-
ficer shall— 

(1) Immediately withhold such funds 
as are available; 

(2) Give the contractor written noti-
fication of the withholding and a state-
ment of the basis for the liquidated 
damages assessment. The written noti-
fication shall also inform the con-
tractor of its 60 days right to appeal 
the assessment, through the con-
tracting officer, to the agency official 
responsible for acting on such appeals; 
and 

(3) If funds available for withholding 
are insufficient to cover liquidated 
damages, ask the contractor to pay 
voluntarily such funds as are necessary 
to cover the total liquidated damage 
assessment. 
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