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(3) The adjusted service computation 
date includes all actual creditable serv-
ice under paragraph (a) and paragraph 
(b) of this section, and additional re-
tention service credit for performance 
authorized by § 351.504 (d) and (e). 

(d) The service computation date is 
computed on the following basis: 

(1) The effective date of appointment 
as a Federal employee under 5 U.S.C. 
2105(a) when the employee has no pre-
vious creditable service under para-
graph (a) or (b) of this section; or if ap-
plicable, 

(2) The date calculated by sub-
tracting the employee’s total previous 
creditable service under paragraph (a) 
or (b) of this section from the most re-
cent effective date of appointment as a 
Federal employee under 5 U.S.C. 
2105(a). 

(e) The adjusted service computation 
date is calculated by subtracting from 
the date in paragraph (d)(1) or (d)(2) of 
this section the additional service 
credit for retention authorized by 
§ 351.504(d) and (e). 

[64 FR Apr. 7, 1999; 64 FR 23531, May 3, 1999]

§ 351.504 Credit for performance.
NOTE TO § 351.504: Compliance dates: Sub-

ject to the requirements of 5 U.S.C. Section 
7116(a)(7), agencies may implement revised 
§ 351.504 at any time between December 24, 
1997 and October 1, 1998. For reduction in 
force actions effective between December 24, 
1997 and September 30, 1998, agencies may 
use either § 351.504 effective December 24, 
1997, or the prior § 351.504 in 5 CFR part 351 
(January 1, 1997 edition).

(a) Ratings used. (1) Only ratings of 
record as defined in § 351.203 shall be 
used as the basis for granting addi-
tional retention service credit in a re-
duction in force. 

(2) For employees who received rat-
ings of record while covered by part 
430, subpart B, of this chapter, those 
ratings of record shall be used to grant 
additional retention service credit in a 
reduction in force. 

(3) For employees who received per-
formance ratings while not covered by 
the provisions of 5 U.S.C. Chapter 43 
and part 430, subpart B, of this chapter, 
those performance ratings shall be con-
sidered ratings of record for granting 
additional retention service credit in a 
reduction in force only when it is de-

termined that those performance rat-
ings are equivalent ratings of record 
under the provisions of § 430.201(c) of 
this chapter. The agency conducting 
the reduction in force shall make that 
determination. 

(b)(1) An employee’s entitlement to 
additional retention service credit for 
performance under this subpart shall 
be based on the employee’s three most 
recent ratings of record received during 
the 4-year period prior to the date of 
issuance of reduction in force notices, 
except as otherwise provided in para-
graphs (b)(2) and (c) of this section. 

(2) To provide adequate time to de-
termine employee retention standing, 
an agency may provide for a cutoff 
date, a specified number of days prior 
to the issuance of reduction in force 
notices after which no new ratings of 
record will be put on record and used 
for purposes of this subpart. When a 
cutoff date is used, an employee will 
receive performance credit for the 
three most recent ratings of record re-
ceived during the 4-year period prior to 
the cutoff date. 

(3) To be creditable for purposes of 
this subpart, a rating of record must 
have been issued to the employee, with 
all appropriate reviews and signatures, 
and must also be on record (i.e., the 
rating of record is available for use by 
the office responsible for establishing 
retention registers). 

(4) The awarding of additional reten-
tion service credit based on perform-
ance for purposes of this subpart must 
be uniformly and consistently applied 
within a competitive area, and must be 
consistent with the agency’s appro-
priate issuance(s) that implement 
these policies. Each agency must speci-
fy in its appropriate issuance(s): 

(i) The conditions under which a rat-
ing of record is considered to have been 
received for purposes of determining 
whether it is within the 4-year period 
prior to either the date the agency 
issues reduction in force notices or the 
agency-established cutoff date for rat-
ings of record, as appropriate; and 

(ii) If the agency elects to use a cut-
off date, the number of days prior to 
the issuance of reduction in force no-
tices after which no new ratings of 
record will be put on record and used 
for purposes of this subpart.
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(c) Missing ratings. Additional reten-
tion service credit for employees who 
do not have three actual ratings of 
record during the 4-year period prior to 
the date of issuance of reduction in 
force notices or the 4-year period prior 
to the agency-established cutoff date 
for ratings of record permitted in para-
graph (b)(2) of this section shall be de-
termined under paragraphs (d) or (e) of 
this section, as appropriate, and as fol-
lows: 

(1) An employee who has not received 
any rating of record during the 4-year 
period shall receive credit for perform-
ance based on the modal rating for the 
summary level pattern that applies to 
the employee’s official position of 
record at the time of the reduction in 
force. 

(2) An employee who has received at 
least one but fewer than three previous 
ratings of record during the 4-year pe-
riod shall receive credit for perform-
ance on the basis of the value of the ac-
tual rating(s) of record divided by the 
number of actual ratings received. If an 
employee has received only two actual 
ratings of record during the period, the 
value of the ratings is added together 
and divided by two (and rounded in the 
case of a fraction to the next higher 
whole number) to determine the 
amount of additional retention service 
credit. If an employee has received 
only one actual rating of record during 
the period, its value is the amount of 
additional retention service credit pro-
vided. 

(d) Single rating pattern. If all employ-
ees in a reduction in force competitive 
area have received ratings of record 
under a single pattern of summary lev-
els as set forth in § 430.208(d) of this 
chapter, the additional retention serv-
ice credit provided to employees shall 
be expressed in additional years of 
service and shall consist of the mathe-
matical average (rounded in the case of 
a fraction to the next higher whole 
number) of the employee’s applicable 
ratings of record, under paragraphs 
(b)(1) and (c) of this section computed 
on the following basis: 

(1) Twenty additional years of service 
for each rating of record with a Level 5 
(Outstanding or equivalent) summary; 

(2) Sixteen additional years of service 
for each rating of record with a Level 4 
summary; and 

(3) Twelve additional years of service 
for each rating of record with a Level 3 
(Fully Successful or equivalent) sum-
mary. 

(e) Multiple rating patterns. If an agen-
cy has employees in a competitive area 
who have ratings of record under more 
than one pattern of summary levels, as 
set forth in § 430.208(d) of this chapter, 
it shall consider the mix of patterns 
and provide additional retention serv-
ice credit for performance to employ-
ees expressed in additional years of 
service in accordance with the fol-
lowing: 

(1) Additional years of service shall 
consist of the mathematical average 
(rounded in the case of a fraction to 
the next higher whole number) of the 
additional retention service credit that 
the agency established for the sum-
mary levels of the employee’s applica-
ble rating(s) of record. 

(2) The agency shall establish the 
amount of additional retention service 
credit provided for summary levels 
only in full years; the agency shall not 
establish additional retention service 
credit for summary levels below Level 
3 (Fully Successful or equivalent). 

(3) When establishing additional re-
tention service credit for the summary 
levels at Level 3 (Fully Successful or 
equivalent) and above, the agency shall 
establish at least 12 years, and no more 
than 20 years, additional retention 
service credit for a summary level. 

(4) The agency may establish the 
same number of years additional reten-
tion service credit for more than one 
summary level. 

(5) The agency shall establish the 
same number of years additional reten-
tion service credit for all ratings of 
record with the same summary level in 
the same pattern of summary levels as 
set forth in § 430.208(d) of this chapter. 

(6) The agency may establish a dif-
ferent number of years additional re-
tention service credit for the same 
summary level in different patterns. 

(7) In implementing paragraph (e) of 
this section, the agency shall specify
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the number(s) of years additional re-
tention service credit that it will es-
tablish for summary levels. This infor-
mation shall be made readily available 
for review. 

(8) The agency may apply paragraph 
(e) of this section only to ratings of 
record put on record on or after Octo-
ber 1, 1997. The agency shall establish 
the additional retention service credit 
for ratings of record put on record 
prior to that date in accordance with 
paragraph (d) of this section. 

[62 FR 62501, Nov. 24, 1997]

§ 351.505 Records. 
(a) The agency is responsible for 

maintaining correct personnel records 
that are used to determine the reten-
tion standing of its employees com-
peting for retention under this part. 

(b) The agency must allow its reten-
tion registers and related records to be 
inspected by: 

(1) An employee of the agency who 
has received a specific reduction in 
force notice, and/or the employee’s rep-
resentative if the representative is act-
ing on behalf of the individual em-
ployee; and 

(2) An authorized representative of 
OPM. 

(c) An employee who has received a 
specific notice of reduction in force 
under authority of subpart H of this 
part has the right to review any com-
pleted records used by the agency in a 
reduction in force action that was 
taken, or will be taken, against the 
employee, including: 

(1) The complete retention register 
with the released employee’s name and 
other relevant retention information 
(including the names of all other em-
ployees listed on that register, their in-
dividual service computation dates cal-
culated under § 351.503(d), and their ad-
justed service computation dates cal-
culated under § 351.503(e)) so that the 
employee may consider how the agency 
constructed the competitive level, and 
how the agency determined the rel-
ative retention standing of the com-
peting employees; and 

(2) The complete retention registers 
for other positions that could affect 
the composition of the employee’s 
competitive level, and/or the deter-

mination of the employee’s assignment 
rights (e.g., registers to which the re-
leased employee may have potential 
assignment rights under § 351.701(b) and 
(c)). 

(d) An employee who has not received 
a specific reduction in force notice has 
no right to review the agency’s reten-
tion registers and related records. 

(e) The agency is responsible for en-
suring that each employee’s access to 
retention records is consistent with 
both the Freedom of Information Act (5 
U.S.C. 552), and the Privacy Act (5 
U.S.C. 552a). 

(f) The agency must preserve all reg-
isters and records relating to a reduc-
tion in force for at least 1 year after 
the date it issues a specific reduction 
in force notice. 

[64 FR 16800, Apr. 7, 1999]

§ 351.506 Effective date of retention 
standing. 

Except for applying the performance 
factor as provided in § 351.504: 

(a) The retention standing of each 
employee released from a competitive 
level in the order prescribed in § 351.601 
is determined as of the date the em-
ployee is so released. 

(b) The retention standing of each 
employee retained in a competitive 
level as an exception under § 351.606(b), 
§ 351.607, or § 351.608, is determined as of 
the date the employee would have been 
released had the exception not been 
used. The retention standing of each 
employee retained under any of these 
provisions remains fixed until comple-
tion of the reduction in force action 
which resulted in the temporary reten-
tion. 

(c) When an agency discovers an 
error in the determination of an em-
ployee’s retention standing, it shall 
correct the error and adjust any erro-
neous reduction-in-force action to ac-
cord with the employee’s proper reten-
tion standing as of the effective date 
established by this section. 

[51 FR 319, Jan. 3, 1986, as amended at 60 FR 
3063, Jan. 13, 1995; 62 FR 10682, Mar. 10, 1997]
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