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as that party deems warranted with re-
spect to such discovery. The service of 
a discovery request shall be made at 
least 20 days before the scheduled date 
of the hearing unless the ALJ specifies 
a shorter time period. Copies of inter-
rogatories, requests for admission and 
requests for production of documents 
and responses thereto shall be served 
on all parties and a copy of the certifi-
cate of service shall be filed with the 
ALJ. Matters of fact or law of which 
admission is requested shall be deemed 
admitted unless, within a period des-
ignated in the request (at least 10 days 
after service, or within such additional 
time as the ALJ may allow), the party 
to whom the request is directed serves 
upon the requesting party a sworn 
statement either denying specifically 
the matters of which admission is re-
quested or setting forth in detail the 
reasons why the party to whom the re-
quest is directed cannot truthfully ei-
ther admit or deny such matters. 

(c) Depositions. Upon application of a 
party and for good cause shown, the 
ALJ may order the taking of the testi-
mony of any person by deposition and 
the production of specified documents 
or materials by the person at the depo-
sition. The application shall state the 
purpose of the deposition and set forth 
the facts sought to be established 
through the deposition. 

(d) Enforcement. The ALJ may order a 
party to answer designated questions, 
to produce specified documents or 
things or to take any other action in 
response to a proper discovery request. 
If a party does not comply with such an 
order, the ALJ may make a determina-
tion or enter any order in the pro-
ceeding as the ALJ deems reasonable 
and appropriate. The ALJ may strike 
related charges or defenses in whole or 
in part or may take particular facts re-
lating to the discovery request to 
which the party failed or refused to re-
spond as being established for purposes 
of the proceeding in accordance with 
the contentions of the party seeking 
discovery. In addition, enforcement by 
any district court of the United States 
in which venue is proper may be sought 
as appropriate.

§ 719.11 Subpoenas. 
(a) Issuance. Upon the application of 

any party, supported by a satisfactory 
showing that there is substantial rea-
son to believe that the evidence would 
not otherwise be available, the ALJ 
may issue subpoenas to any person re-
quiring the attendance and testimony 
of witnesses and the production of such 
books, records or other documentary or 
physical evidence for the purpose of the 
hearing, as the ALJ deems relevant 
and material to the proceedings, and 
reasonable in scope. Witnesses shall be 
paid the same fees and mileage that are 
paid to witnesses in the courts of the 
United States. In case of contempt, 
challenge or refusal to obey a subpoena 
served upon any person pursuant to 
this paragraph, any district court of 
the United States, in which venue is 
proper, has jurisdiction to issue an 
order requiring any such person to 
comply with such subpoena. Any fail-
ure to obey such order of the court is 
punishable by the court as a contempt 
thereof. 

(b) Service. Subpoenas issued by the 
ALJ may be served by any of the meth-
ods set forth in § 719.8(b). 

(c) Timing. Applications for sub-
poenas must be submitted at least 10 
days before the scheduled hearing or 
deposition, unless the ALJ determines, 
for good cause shown, that extraor-
dinary circumstances warrant a short-
er time.

§ 719.12 Matters protected against dis-
closure. 

(a) Protective measures. The ALJ may 
limit discovery or introduction of evi-
dence or issue such protective or other 
orders as in the ALJ’s judgment may 
be needed to prevent undue disclosure 
of classified or sensitive documents or 
information, including Confidential 
Business Information as defined by the 
Act. Where the ALJ determines that 
documents containing classified or sen-
sitive matter must be made available 
to a party in order to avoid prejudice, 
the ALJ may direct the other party to 
prepare an unclassified and nonsen-
sitive summary or extract of the docu-
ments. The ALJ may compare the ex-
tract or summary with the original to 
ensure that it is supported by the 
source document and that it omits 
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only so much as must remain undis-
closed. The summary or extract may be 
admitted as evidence in the record. 

(b) Arrangements for access. If the ALJ 
determines that the summary proce-
dure outlined in paragraph (a) of this 
section is unsatisfactory, and that 
classified or otherwise sensitive matter 
must form part of the record in order 
to avoid prejudice to a party, the ALJ 
may provide the parties opportunity to 
make arrangements that permit a 
party or a representative to have ac-
cess to such matter without compro-
mising sensitive information. Such ar-
rangements may include obtaining se-
curity clearances or giving counsel for 
a party access to sensitive information 
and documents subject to assurances 
against further disclosure, including a 
protective order, if necessary.

§ 719.13 Prehearing conference. 
(a) On the ALJ’s own motion, or on 

request of a party, the ALJ may direct 
the parties to participate in a pre-
hearing conference, either in person or 
by telephone, to consider: 

(1) Simplification of issues; 
(2) The necessity or desirability of 

amendments to pleadings; 
(3) Obtaining stipulations of fact and 

of documents to avoid unnecessary 
proof; or (4) Such other matters as may 
expedite the disposition of the pro-
ceedings. 

(b) The ALJ may order the con-
ference proceedings to be recorded elec-
tronically or taken by a reporter, tran-
scribed and filed with the ALJ. 

(c) If a prehearing conference is im-
practicable, the ALJ may direct the 
parties to correspond with the ALJ to 
achieve the purposes of such a con-
ference. 

(d) The ALJ will prepare a summary 
of any actions agreed on or taken pur-
suant to this section. The summary 
will include any written stipulations or 
agreements made by the parties.

§ 719.14 Hearings. 
(a) Scheduling. Upon receipt of a writ-

ten and dated request for a hearing, the 
ALJ shall, by agreement with all the 
parties or upon notice to all parties of 
at least 30 days, schedule a hearing. All 
hearings will be held in Washington, 
D.C., unless the ALJ determines, for 

good cause shown, that another loca-
tion would better serve the interest of 
justice. 

(b) Hearing procedure. Hearings will 
be conducted in a fair and impartial 
manner by the ALJ. All hearings will 
be closed, unless the ALJ for good 
cause shown determines otherwise. The 
rules of evidence prevailing in courts of 
law do not apply, and all evidentiary 
material deemed by the ALJ to be rel-
evant and material to the proceeding 
and not unduly repetitious will be re-
ceived and given appropriate weight, 
except that any evidence of settlement 
which would be excluded under Rule 408 
of the Federal Rules of Evidence is not 
admissible. Witnesses will testify 
under oath or affirmation, and shall be 
subject to cross-examination. 

(c) Testimony and record. (1) A ver-
batim record of the hearing and of any 
other oral proceedings will be taken by 
reporter or by electronic recording, and 
filed with the ALJ. If any party wishes 
to obtain a written copy of the tran-
script, that party shall pay the costs of 
transcription. The parties may share 
the costs if both wish a transcript. 

(2) Upon such terms as the ALJ 
deems just, the ALJ may direct that 
the testimony of any person be taken 
by deposition and may admit an affi-
davit or declaration as evidence, pro-
vided that any affidavits or declara-
tions have been filed and served on the 
parties sufficiently in advance of the 
hearing to permit a party to file and 
serve an objection thereto on the 
grounds that it is necessary that the 
affiant or declarant testify at the hear-
ing and be subject to cross-examina-
tion. 

(d) Failure to appear. If a party fails 
to appear in person or by counsel at a 
scheduled hearing, the hearing may 
nevertheless proceed. The party’s fail-
ure to appear will not affect the valid-
ity of the hearing or any proceeding or 
action taken thereafter.

§ 719.15 Procedural stipulations. 

Unless otherwise ordered and subject 
to § 719.16, a written stipulation agreed 
to by all parties and filed with the ALJ 
will modify the procedures established 
by this part.
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