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Fact Sheet 

U.S. Dependence on Foreign Oil 
 
 
In public statements, President Bush has repeatedly emphasized the need to reduce U.S. 
dependence on foreign oil.  The policies pursued by the Administration have had the opposite 
effect, however.  Estimates from the Department of Energy show that U.S. dependence on 
foreign oil is projected to increase by nearly 85% under the policies proposed by President Bush. 
 
The President’s Public Statements 
 
President Bush has spoken repeatedly about the need to address the problem of dependence on 
foreign oil.  In his first address to Congress, he stated, “America must become more energy-
independent, and we will.”1  In the 2002 State of the Union Address, he stated, “This Congress 
must act . . . so America is less dependent on foreign oil.”2  In the 2003 State of the Union 
Address, he stated that his “goal is to promote energy independence for our country.”3  In the 
2004 State of the Union address, he stated, “I urge [Congress] to pass legislation to . . . make 
America less dependent on foreign sources of energy.”4   
 
The Bush Administration’s Energy Policy   
 
Shortly after the Bush Administration assumed office, Vice President Dick Cheney convened an 
energy task force to develop the Administration’s energy policy.  The proposed policy, which 
was revealed in May 2001, included 105 recommendations.5  By May 2002, Energy Secretary 
Spencer Abraham reported that the Administration had either completed or was near completing 
over 60 of the 105 recommendations.6     
 
An analysis by the Energy Information Administration (EIA), an independent agency of the U.S. 
Department of Energy, shows that the energy policy changes implemented by the Bush 
Administration have not reduced the nation’s projected need for foreign oil.  In December 2000, 
EIA projected, under policies in effect at that time, that the nation would need to import 
approximately 16.5 million barrels of petroleum per day in 2020. 7  In January 2004, EIA 
projected that the nation would need to import approximately 17.5 million barrels per day in 
2020 — an increase of 6%.8  
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The Republican Energy Bill  
 
The energy policy recommendations in the Bush Administration’s plan that require 
congressional approval are contained in H.R. 6, which has passed the Republican-controlled 
House but has stalled in the U.S. Senate.  According to EIA, if H.R. 6 is enacted the nation will 
need to import approximately 19.45 million barrels of petroleum per day by 2025.  This 
represents nearly an 85% increase over 2002 levels.9  
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