F:\RWC\NDAO03\

fo

R NN AW

10
11
12
13
14
15
16

7
18
19
20

April 29, 2002 (8:57 AM)

COWATAA.002 HL.C.

AMENDMENT TO H.R. 4547

OFFERED BY MR. STUMP

Strike all after the enacting clause and insert

llOWing:

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Cost of War Against
Terrorism Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2003”
SEC. 2. ADDITIONAL AUTHORIZATIONS

Amounts authorized to be appropriated by this Act
are in addition to other amounts authorized to be appro-
priated for military functions of the Department of De-
fense for fiscal year 20083

TITLE I—PROCUREMENT

SEC. 101. ARMY.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal year 2003 for Other Procurement, Army, in the
amount of $10,700,000.

SEC. 102. NAVY AND MARINE CORPS.

(a) NAVY.—Funds are hereby authorized to be appro-
priated for fiscal year 2003 for procurement for the Navy
as follows:

(1) For aircraft, $106,000,000.
(2) For weapons, including missiles and

pedoes, $598,000,000.

F:\V7\042902\042502.014



F:\RWC\NDAO3\COWATAA.002 HL.C.

e e Y I U S

O o©

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

2

(b) MARINE CORPS.—Funds are hereby authorized to
be appropriated for fiscal year 2003 for procurement for
the Marine Corps in the amount of $25,200,000.

(e) NAVY AND MARINE CORPS AMMUNITION.—Funds
are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year
2003 for procurement of ammunition for the Navy and
the Marine Corps in the amount of $95,600,000.

SEC. 103. AIR FORCE.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal year 2003 for procurement for the Air Force as fol-
lows:

(1) For aireraft, $214,550,000.

(2) For ammunition, $117,900,000.

(4) For other procurement, $10,800,000.
SEC. 104. DEFENSE-WIDE ACTIVITIES.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal year 2003 for Defense-wide procurement in the
amount of $616,414,000.

SEC. 105. GLOBAL INFORMATION GRID SYSTEM.

None of the funds authorized to be appropriated by
this Act for the Department of Defense system known as
the Global Information Grid may be obligated until the
Secretary of Defense certifies to the congressional defense

committees that the end-to-end system is secure and pro-

April 29, 2002 (8:57 AM)
F:\V7\04280210429802.014



FARWC\NDAO3\COWATAA.002 H.L.C.

[u—

O o0 N N b~ WwWoN

L o e N T S
E-)S\OOO\IO\UI#WN'—‘O

3
tected from unauthorized access to the information trans-

mitted through the system.

TITLE II—RESEARCH, DEVELOP-
MENT, TEST, AND EVALUA-
TION

SEC. 201. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal year 2003 for the use of the Department of Defense
for research, development, test, and evaluation for De-

fense-wide activities in the amount of $390,100,000.

TITLE III—OPERATION AND
MAINTENANCE

SEC. 301. OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE FUNDING.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for
fiscal year 2003 for the use of the Armed Forces for ex-
penses, not otherwise provided for, for operation and
maintenance, in amounts as follows:

(1) For the Army, $14,400,000.

(2) For the Navy, $5,300,000.

(3) For the Marine Corps, $11,500,000.
(4) For the Air Force, $900,000,000.

April 29, 2002 (8:57 AM)
F\V7\0429021042902.014



FARWC\NDAO3\COWATAA.002 HL.C.

O 00 N N AW N

[y
o

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19

April 29, 2002 (8:57 AM)

4

TITLE IV—-MILITARY
PERSONNEL

SEC. 401. AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR MILI-
TARY PERSONNEL.

There is hereby authorized to be appropriated to the
Department of Defense for military personnel for fiscal
year 2003 a total of $503,100,000.

TITLE V—WARTIME PAY AND
ALLOWANCE INCREASES

SEC. 501. INCREASE IN RATE FOR FAMILY SEPARATION AL-
LOWANCE.
Section 427(a)(1) of title 37, United States Code, is
amended by striking “$100” and inserting “$125”
SEC. 502. INCREASE IN RATES FOR VARIOUS HAZARDOUS
DUTY INCENTIVE PAYS.
(a) FLIGHT PAY FOR CREW MEMBERS.—Subsection
(b) of section 301 of title 37, United States Code, is
amended by striking the table and inserting the following

new table:

“Pay grade: Mﬂ"‘“.l; ;f(';f(;
O=10 oo et e e e s e esbessbs e ase s ae s e e aeaba e rean
020 oot e s ae st et r e s et e b e e e s b b e e b e e ersseshsereennenasanrasnnteaans $200
[0 U PO ROt $200
O =T e eeereereectee e rresaestr e e et se s e e s st e s s b e an b e seen e e s e e eserrbeeneeaseraananterane $200
D6 et rerre et eerres e s sae e sa s e e ras e saa e e s e e e aa s aeratsereeabenreeesnasnesans $300
Db it e e e e st a e st a e b e b arbeete s st et eenneeatares $300
D= iviies e rerres s et sess e e s e s b re e nassae st sesnaaaesateens $275
O3 it errrrrerrerart e s e s ss s r s e sesannrssnnrensnsarasernnanasseranes $225
O et et es st b e s est e s be e s e e e e as et eenaarareanaeans $200
O=1 it et tes bt tar e e srasaase e nareeesranesnnsersssnaraeans $200
B YOO $300
Wd s b e e esre st e e e e s eae s s asae s s erasesasaananas $300
B it errrerecrrenr e e es e s e ar s r e es e a e reanee enaesteasteseeesseessctas $225

F:\V71042902\042902.014



FARWCANDAO3\COWATAA.002 HL.C

5
“Pay grade: Monthly Rate
Wo2 et ettt et sa st e e b $200
Wl coiiiniiiccetne et reesraeesanessesensssss st sesnsnssssasstsssssasassseseresensanees $200
B et s s st $290
B et e e e a e s $290
BT ittt et as et e e e e s e $290
B et et s s $265
Ead ottt bt e sn e s et $240
B et et ep et rn e $215
B8 sttt et st sesa et n $200
B2 e sttt s e n e $200
Bl ettt sttt sr et en e $200”

O 00 N O U A WD e

I T e T e e e e e e
O o0 N N A~ W N = O

April 29, 2002 (8:57 AM)
F:\V7\042902\042902.014

(b) INCENTIVE PAY FOR PARACHUTE JUMPING

WITHOUT STATIC LINE.—Subsection (¢)(1) of such sec-

tion is amended by striking ‘“$225’’ and inserting “$275”.

(¢) OTHER HAZARDOUS DUTIES.—Subsection (e)(1)

of such section is amended by striking “$150” and insert-

ing “$200”.

(d) REMOVAL OF AIR WEAPONS CONTROLLER CREW

MEMBERS FFROM LIST OF HAZARDOUS DUTIES.—Such

section is further amended—

(1) in subsection (a)—
(A) by striking paragraph (12);
(B) in paragraph (11), by striking ‘‘; or”
and inserting a period; and
(C) in paragraph (10), by inserting ‘“or”’
after the semicolon; and
(2) in subsection (¢), as amended by sub-
sections (b) and (c¢) of this section—
(A) by striking “(1)”’; and
(B) by striking paragraph (2).



FARWC\NDAO3\COWATAA.002 H.L.C.

ok

NN L AW

O o

10
11
12
13
14

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

April 29, 2002 (8:57 AM)
F:\V7\0429021042902.01

6
SEC. 503. INCREASE IN RATE FOR DIVING DUTY SPECIAL

PAY.
Section 304(b) of title 37, United States Code, is
amended—
(1) by striking “$240” and inserting “$290”’;
and
(2) by striking “$340” and inserting “$390”"
SEC. 504. INCREASE IN RATE FOR IMMINENT DANGER PAY.
Section 310(a) of title 37, United States Code, is
amended by striking “$150” and inserting “$250”".
SEC. 505. INCREASE IN RATE FOR CAREER ENLISTED
FLYER INCENTIVE PAY.
The table in section 320(d) of title 37, United States

Code, is amended to read as follows:

“Years of aviation service Monthly rate
Q0T 1SS oo $200
OVET 4 et e $275
OVEE B oottt et eee e $400
OVET 14 oo $450.”,

SEC. 506. INCREASE IN AMOUNT OF DEATH GRATUITY.
Section 1478(a) of title 10, United States Code, is
amended by striking “$6,000” and inserting “$12,000”"
SEC. 507. EFFECTIVE DATE.
(a) IN GENERAL.—The amendments made by this
title shall take effect on the later of the following:
(1 The first day of the first month beginning
on or after the date of the enactment of this Act.
(2) October 1, 2002

4



FARWC\NDAO3\COWATAA.002

W 00 9 0N Bt AW

e e Y
W N = O

15
16
17
18

19
20

7
(b) DEATH GRATUITY.—The amendment made by
section 506 shall apply with respect to a person covered
by section 1475 or 1476 of title 10, United States Code,
whose date of death occurs on or after the later of the
following:
(1 The first day of the first month beginning
on or after the date of the enactment of this
(2) October 1, 2002.
TITLE VI—MILITARY CONSTRUC-
TION AUTHORIZATIONS

SEC. 601. AUTHORIZED MILITARY CONSTRUCTION AND
LAND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

(a) PROJECTS AUTHORIZED. -Using amounts appro-
priated pursuant to the authorization of appropriations in
subsection (b), the Secretary of the military department
concerned may acquire real property and carry out
tary construction projects for the installations and loca-

tions, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:

Projects Authorized

Military Department Installation or location Amount
Department of the Army ...... QALAT ..o eeneee $8,600,000
Department of the Navy ....... Naval Station, Guantanamo Bay,

CUDA .coverrrreeeerrcreeereeee e $4,280,000
Naval Station, Rota, Spain .............. $18,700,000
Department of the Air Foree | Bolling Air Force Base, District of
Columbia .....cceveeeeeveeerrererenreenenne $3,500,000
Total ........ $35,080,000

(b) AUTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATIONS.—Funds

are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year

April 29, 2002 (8:57 AM)
F:\V7\042902\042902.014



FARWC\NDA03\COWATAA.002 HL.C.
8

1 2003 for the military construction projects authorized by
2 subsection (a) in the total amount of $35,080,000.

April 29, 2002 (8:57 AM)
F:\V7\042902\042902.014



