
F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

] 07'1'11 (:~ONGI~]!jSS
2]) SESH]ON

.

[Report No. 107-

To allthorizl" appropriations for fis(~al year 2003 for rnilital';\' at,ti,'itit"s of

tilt' Deparhnt~nt of Dl'fenst" and to pres(~ribe rnilital';\' persorn1el su'engt,hs
f" f~ I ? ()O')or lS{".c) )'ear OJ V.

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATnffiS

APRIL 23, 2002

Mr. STUMP (for himself and Mr. SIillLTON) (l)()th by request) introduced the
following bill; which was refel"OO to the Colmnittee on AI,ned Sel'\rices

,JuLY,2002
Reported WitIl an aJnendment, committed to tIle (~olmnittee of tIle Whole

House on tIle Shl.te of tIle Union and ordered to be printed

[Stlike out all aft~r tile enaeting elause and inselt tile pa.Jt plinted ill italic]

[~-'or text of intrtmueecl bill, Sl~e (,opy of bill as inh'Odueed on Aplil 23, 2002)

To authorize appropriations fOl~ fiscal year 2003 for military

activities of the Department of Defense and to prescribe

military personnel strengths for fiscal year 2003.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-

2 tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,

July 19, 2002

F:\V7\O71 !=IO?\O71 !=1O? 01:'\



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

2

1 SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE; TABLE OF CONTENTS.

2 (a) SHUR7' Tn'I-lliJ.- This Act may be cited as the "Cost

3 of War Against Terroris11't Authorization Act of 2002".

4 (b) T.ll::I-.lI? VIr CO1V'lEN'l',~.-The table of contents of this

5 Act is as follows:

,S-cr. 1. I~htni titlt'; tabu, qf rolltt'llt.\'.

IS-Ct'. 2. AlluHmts a'/tthO1'izct] .tor tht, "'ar 011 TC'/'1"01'i5111.

,S-ec. 3. Additional tt'/ttho'rizatiO1I.\'

1'lTLE I-AlTTHORIZ.41'ION OF .-ll'PROPRIATI()NS

.~ubt-itle A-.4uthoriZ<1t-i0/1S to T'ran~fer .4l~~O/mts

,~cc. 101. n'({'r an 7'c'rrorisJII Oper(ftiou.s- Fmtd.

,~c<'. 102. \l-'({J. on Tcrrorisul Eq1f.'ipu/<,ut RepToc'Cuu'ut ({JuT J;]JUUfUC'{'UU'ut Fu.'//~T.

SeC'. 103. (lc'u('raT provi.s-'ious cf.11'pl'i.cabT<, to t'rau~t('J"S.

.~ubtitl~ B-AuthJJ'rizations to .~p('(~ifi('d Ac(~omlt.~

Sec. 111. A'rmy pro<~urenl~/lf.
Se{'. 112. Nat'Y ai/d Manne ('OI'lJS p'/"(/('tN"e'/llenf.
I~e~. 113. .4'i'r Force p'rocureJneJtt.
Se{'. 114. D~fe'/tse-'l("ide actit'ities procurelll~nt.
Se{'. 115. R(~search. d{~t'eu}pJnent. test, aitd et,aJu(ltion, d~tcnse-lvid~.
Sec. 116. ("1(1ss!ficd a(,tit,iti(~s.
Sec. 117. G/()ba] Inform~ltiml (,Trid S:!/ste'/ll.
Se{'. 118. Operation and maiJttena'/l{,~.
Sec. 119. Milita1,!! pe1~onnel.

lS'ubtitle G-l1fih:ta'/y (~O'nstructimt A.1tthoriz(ftions

.gee. 131. .4uthorized ",/if.itary ('onsh.,,(,tiou alia lImd a(~qui.,,'ition pr(ljert.~.

1'lTLE II-H:ARTIME PAY AND ALLOH:4N(~E INCREASES

.~ec. 201. blcrease 'in rate .for.fiTm';l!/ separation ((1J~J1l'mlc~'.

.~ec. 202. ].((l:('Casc ;'n rat('s.for V((1';oI(S h~(z((rdOl(s duty ';nc~,,"t;.,'c P((ys.

Sc(~. 20.'1, lIu,.,'('as(' ;.,1 'r((te for d';v;""g dut:1/ S'P(,(~;((1 pa:l/.

.S'el:. 204. lIIc'r£!((sc in .,.((tc ,fi.lr ;ll1.1n;.,/('lIt dm/yer P((y.

.S'el:. 20.5. }(Icre((se ;.,1 .,'ate fol' (~areer e1uisted fl!/er ;n('ent;v(' pa!/.

Sec, 20(). m(~rcase ,in mnOltnt of d{!ath gr((tuit!/.

Sel:. 207. Effecti've d((te.

TITLE III-ADDITIONAL PROl-7,S'IONS

,~(~c. ..'101. Est(fblishl/I.(~nt qt. 1ft U~(fst Iinc lVI'a/x/ns I~f' MlfSS f)1~str/(ctiO'// (~i1,il ,~up-

pori 7'c(w/ 'i1/ ciu:h Stall'.
'~l'C. ,;'02. .41fthority .for joint tffsli: .f!wC{'S to prm'id{' support to UfUJ cl(forc(:nlRI/t

IfgC1/l,ics co/uhu,ting c{m1/tcr-tc/rori.~ln fu,ti'l,itil'S.

'~l'{'. 3().,.. '~l'n.~l: lif (-'I)'nfJrcs.~ on If..,..~istlH/CC to .f;l:.,-t f'I'S/J()1It!C,/:"-.

July 19, 2002

F"\V7\O71 QO?\O71 QO? m~



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

3

SEC. 2. AMOUNTS AUTHORIZED FOR THE WAR ON TER-

2 RORISM.

3 The amounts autltorized to be appropriated in this

4 Act, totalling $10,000,000,000, are authorized for the con-

5 duct of operations in continuation of the war on terrorism

6 in accordance with the Authorization for Use of Military

7 Force (Public Law 107-40; 50 U.S.C. 1541 note) and, to

8 tlw extent appropriations are made pursuant to such au-

9 tlwrizations, shall only be expended in a manner consistent

10 witl", th£ purposes stated in section 2(a) th£reof

SEC. 3. ADDITIONAL AUTHORIZATIONS

12 The amounts autlwrized to be appropriated by this Act

13 are in addition to amounts authorized to be appropriated

14 for military functions of the Departn1,ent of Defe11,se for fis-

15 cal year 2003 in the National Defense Authorization Act

16 for Fiscal Year 2003 or any other Act.

17 TITLE I-AUTHORIZATION OF

APPROPRIATIONS18

Subtitle A-Authorizations to19

20

21 SEC. 101. WAR ON TERRORISM OPERATIONS FUND.

22 (a) AtTTI:lORIZ.4TION OF APPROPRIA7'I()NS.- There is

23 hereby authorized to be appropriated to the Department of

24 Defense for fiscal year 2003 the amount of $3,544,682,000,

25 to be available onvy for operations in accordance with the

26 purposes stated in section 2 for Operation Noble Eagle and

July 19, 2002

F:\V7\O71902\O7190201.1



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

4

1 Operation Enduring Freedom. Funds authorized in the pre-

2 ceding sentence may onl/y be used as prlovided in subsection

3

4 (b) TR.4JV~';F'ER AZ:!THORITl',-Subject to section 103,

5 the Secretary of Defense may, in the Secretary's discretion,

6 transfer amounts authorized in subsection (a) to any fiscal

7 year 2003 military personnel or operation and mainte-

8 nance account of the Department of Defense for the purposes

9 stated in that subsection.

10 SEC. 102. WAR ON TERRORISM EQUIPMENT REPLACEMENT

1 AND ENHANCEMENT FUND.

12 (a) A[lTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIATION,~.-There is

13 hereby authorized to be appropriated to the Department of

14 Defense for fiscal year 2003 the amount of $1,000,000,000,

15 to be available only in accordance with the purposes stated

16 in section 2 and to be used only as provided in subsection

17

18 (b) TR~4N.~FER AUTHORITY.-Subject to section 103,

19 the Secretary of Defense may, in the Secretary's discretion,

20 transfer amounts authorized in subsection (a) to any fiscal

year 2003 procurement or research, development, test, and21

22 evaluation account of the Department of Defense for the

23 purpose 0/-

(1) emergency replacement of equipment and24

25 munitions lost or expended in operations condU(:ted

July 19, 2002
F'\V7\()71 ~():>\()71 ~():>m~



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

5

as part of Operation Noble Eagle or Operation En-1

2 du,ring Freedom; or

(2) enha11,Cement of critical military capabilities3

necessary to carry out operations pursuant to Public4

5 Law 107-40.

6 SEC. 103. GENERAL PROVISIONS APPLICABLE TO TRANS-

7 FERS.

(a) 11\1' GENER~4L.-Amounts transferred pursuant to8

9 section 101(b) or 102(b) shall be merged with, and available

10 for the same purposes a1'/,d the same time period as, the ac-

count to which transferred.11

NOTICE-AND-WAIT REQ[JIRE-(b)12 CONGRESSION.4L

MENT.-A transfer may not be made under section 101(b)13

14 or 102(b) until the Secretary of Defense has submitted a

15 notice in writing to the Committees on Armed Services and

16 the Committees on Appropriations of the Senate and House

of Representatives of the proposed transfer and a period of17

18 15 days lws elapsed after the date such notice is received.

19 Any such notice shall include specification of the amount

20 of the proposed transfer, the account to whiclt the transfer

is to be made, and the purpose of the transfer.21

(c) TRANSFER A[lTHORITY CUM[lLATWE.-The trans-22

23 fer authority provided by this subtitle is in addition to any

24 other transfer authority availabl£ to the Secretary of De-

25 fense under this Act or any other Act.

July 19, 2002

F:\V7\071 902\071 90?0I~



July 
19, 2002

F
:\V

7\O
71

F
:\C

A
S

\R
E

P
O

R
T

S
l 

\H
4547 .R

H

902\O
7190201:"i

22 
N

avy and the M

21 19 18 
account for 

the M
arine 

C
orps in 

the am
ount 

of $25,200,000.

17 16 15 14 13 12 
the N

avy in 
a

11 10 8 7 6 
am

ounts as follow
s:

4 3 
S

E
C

. 111. A
R

M
}

2 1

be appropriated 
for 

fiscal 
year 2003 for 

the 1-

pedoes, $633,000,000.

(a) N
A

1'1'."

S
ubtitle 

B
-A

uthorizations 
to

(2) 
F

or 
w

eapons,

(1) F
or aircraft, $106,000,000.

(1) F
or 

am
n'l-unition, 

$94,000,000.

(2) F
or other procu

S
pecified 

A
ccounts

.F
unds are 

hereby authorized 
to be appro-

,,-,'uR
E

M
E

N
T

.

as follow
s.

C
orps in 

the a

20 
are 

hereby authorized 
to be appropriated 

for 
fiscal 

year

2003 for 
the procurem

ent 
account for 

am
m

unition 
for 

the

6

including 
m

issiles and 
tor-

5 
cal 

year 
2003 for 

procurem
ent 

accounts 
of the A

rm
y 

in

F
unds are hereby authorized to be

t, $10,700,000.

,nt 
of $120, 600, 000.

9 
S

E
C

. 112. N
A

V
Y

 A
N

D
 M

A
R

IN
E

 C
O

R
P

S
 P

R
O

C
U

R
E

M
E

N
T

.

priated 
for 

fiscal 
year 2003 for 

procurem
ent 

accounts for

for .fis-

(c) N
41'l' 

~
~

T
D

 M
A

R
IN

E
 

C
O

R
P

S
 A

lIIM
[lN

IT
IO

N
.-F

unds

(b) M
W

I!l7E
 C

oR
P

s.-F
unds 

are 
hereby authorized 

to



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

7

1 SEC. 113. AIR FORCE PROCUREMENT.

2 Funds are hereby autltorized to be appropriated for fis-

3 cal year 2003 for procurement accounts for tlw Air Force

4 in amounts as follows:

5 (1) For aircraft, $214,550,000.

6 (2) For an'tmunition, $157,900,000.

7 (3) For other procurement, $10,800,000.

8 SEC. 114. DEFENSE-WIDE ACTIVITIES PROCUREMENT.

9 Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fis-

lOcal year 2003 for tlw procurement account for Defense-wide

11 procurement in the a11~ount 01$620,414,000.

12 SEC. 115. RESEARCH, DEVELOPMENT, TEST, AND EVALUA-

13 TION, DEFENSE-WIDE.

14 Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fis-

15 cal year 2003 for the research, development, test, and eval-

16 uation account for Defense-wide activities in tlw an'tount

17 01$390,100,000.

18 SEC. 116. CLASSIFIED ACTIVITIES.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for the19

20 Department of Defense for fiscal year 2003 for unspecified

intelligence and classified activities in the amount of

22 $1,980,674,000, of which-

(1) $1,618,874,000 is authorized to be appro-23

24 priated to procurement accounts;

25 (2) $301,600,000 is autJwrized to be appro-

priated to operation and 11'/,aintenance accounts; and26

July 19, 2002

F'\V7\n71 Qn?\n71 Qn? nI~



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

8

(3) $60,200,000 is authorized to be appropriated

2 to research, developl11,ent, test, and evaluation ac-

3 counts.

4 SEC. 117. GLOBAL INFORMATION GRID SYSTEM.

5 None of the funds authorized to be appropriated by this

6 Act for the Department of Defense system known as the

7 Global Information Grid '111,ay be obligated until the Sec-

8 retary of Defense submits to the Committees on Armed Serv-

9 ices and the Committees on Appropriations of the Senate

10 and House of Representatives the Secretary's certification

that the end-to-end system is secure and protected from un-

12 authorized access to the information transmitted through

13 the system.

14 SEC. 118. OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE.

Funds are hereby authorized to be appropriated for fis-15

16 cal year 2003 for the use of the Armed Forces for expenses,

17 not otherwise provided for, for operation and maintenance,

18 in amounts as follows:

19 (1) For the Army, $14,270,000.

20 (2) For the Navy, $5,252,500.

21 (3) For the Marine Corps, $11,396,000.

22 (4) For the Air Force, $517,285,000.

July 19, 2002

F"W7\O7190?\O7190? OI~



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

9

SEC. 119. MILITARY PERSONNEL.

2 There is hereby autltorized to be appropriated to the

3 Department of Defense for 1'}1,ilitary personnel accounts for

4 fiscal year 2003 a total of $503,100,000.

5 Subtitle C-Military Construction

Authorizations6

7 SEC. 181. AUTHORIZED MILITARY CONSTRUCTION AND

8 LAND ACQUISITION PROJECTS.

9 (a) PROJECT~S' Al:TTHORIZED. .Using amounts appro-

10 priated pursuant to the autltorization of appropriations in

1 subsection (b), the Secretary of the military department

12 concerned may acquire real property and carry out mili-

13 tary construction projects for the installations and loca-

14 tions, and in the amounts, set forth in the following table:
Projects Authorized

-Funds 

are5 (b) ArTTHORIZATION OF APPROPRIA1'IONS..

16 hereby authorized to be appropriated for fiscal year 2003

7 for the military construction projects authorized by sub-

18 section (a) in the total amount 01$35,080,000.

July 19, 2002

F:\V7\O71902\O71902.013



F:\CAS\REPORTSl \H4547 .RH

0

TITLE II. .WART/ME PAY AND1

ALLOWANCE INCREASES2

3 SEC. 201. INCREASE IN RATE FOR FAMILY SEPARATION AL-

4 LOWANCE.

5 United States Code, isSection 427(a)(1) of title 37,

"$100" and inserting "$125".6 amended by striking

7 SEC. 202. INCREASE IN RATES FOR VARIOUS HAZARDOUS

8 DUTY INCENTIVE PAYS.

(a) FLIGHT P~4Y FOR CHEnT ME111BERS.9 .Subsection

10 (b) of section 301 of title 37, United States Code, is amend-

11 ed by striking the table and inserting the following new

12

Mmlthly Rate

$200

$200

$200.,... 

$200

, $300

$300

$275
$225
$200

$200

, $300

$300

, $225

$200

$200

$290

$290

, $290

, $265

$240
$215
$200

$200

$200".

Pa,y grad~:
0-10 ,

0-,9 ..,

0-8"

0-7...
0-6...

0-5 ...
0-1 ..,

0-3 ..
0-2 ..,

0-1 ...

liT-5 ...
W--i ...
liT-,)' ...
liT_2 ...
liT_1...
E-9...
E-8...

E-7...
E-6...

E-5...
E--i ...
E-3...
E-2...

E-1...

July 19, 2002
r:.\V7\O71 QO?\O71 QO? m~



F:\CAS\REPORTSl \H4547 .RH

11

1 (b) IJV(~El\!Tn'E PAl' j1~ORP..JR..J(~H[TTE JUJ1IPING WITH,

2 Ol.!T ST.4TI(~ LLi\7E.-Subsection (c) (1, of such section is

3 an~ended by strikil~g "$225" and inserting "$275".

4 (c) OTHER H.4.Z~1RDO[!,S' D[!TIE,S'.

-Subsecti011, 

(c)(l) of

5 such section is amended by striking "$150" and inserting

6 "$200".

7 (d) REMm:4L OF AIR WE.!PONIS' CONTROLLER CREnT

8 MEMBER.S' FROM LI.S'T OF H..4Z..4RDO[TS D[TTIE.S'..

-Such 

sec-

9 lion is further amended-

10 (1) in subsection (a)

11 (A) by striking paragraph (12);

12 (B) in paragrapJt (11), by striking "; or;

13 and inserting a period; and

14 (C) in paragraph (10), by inserting "or"

15 after tM semicolon; and

16 (2) in subsection (c), as amended by subsections

17 (b) and (c) of this section-

18 (A) by striking "(1)"; and

19 (B) by striking paragraph (2).

20 SEC. 203. INCREASE IN RATE FOR DIVING DUTY SPECIAL

21

United States Code,22 Section 304(b) of title 37, 'l,S

23 amended-

24 (1) by striki1~g "$240" and inserting "$290";

25 and

July 19, 2002
r:.\\I7\n71 Qn?\n71 QO? ru~



F:\CAS\REPORTSl \H4547 .RH

12

1 (2) by striking "$340" and inserting "$390".

2 SEC. 204. INCREASE IN RATE FOR IMMINENT DANGER PAY.

3 Section 310(a) of title 37, United States Code, is

4 a1nended by striking "$150" and inserting "$250".

5 SEC. 205. INCREASE IN RATE FOR CAREER ENLISTED FLYER

6 INCENTIVE PAY.

7 The table in section 320( d) of title 37, United States

8 Code, is amended to read as follows:

"Years of aviation service Monthly rate
4 01' ll's.s , " , $200

O'VC1' 4 , , $275

OVC1' 8 $400

Ovc'r 14 $450. ".

9 SEC. 206. INCREASE IN AMOUNT OF DEATH GRATUITY.

10 Section 1478(a) of title 10, United States Code, is

11 amended by striking "$6,000" and inserting "$12,000".

12 SEC. 207. EFFECTIVE DATE.

13 (a) IN GENERAL.-Except as provided in subsection

14 (b), the amendments made by this title shall take effect on

15 the later of the following:

16 (1) The first day of the first month beginning on

17 or after the date of the enactment of this Act.

18 (2) October 1,

19 (b) DEATH GRAT[lITl".-The amendment made by sec-

20 tion 206 shall apply with respect to a person covered by

21 section 1475 or 1476 of title 10, United States Code, whose

22 date of death occurs on or after the later of the following:

(1) The date of the enactment of this Act.23

July 19, 2002
r:.I\/7\n71 on')ln71 on') nl~



F
:\C

A
S

\R
E

P
O

R
T

S
I 

\H
4547 .R

H

24

23

22

21 20 17

16 15 14 13 12

11 1025 19

18 9 8 7 6 5 3 2 1

fights the w
ar against

ported various national 
events, including 

the W
orld

support from
 

civil

use of w
eapons 

of m
ass -~

..

w
ithin 

the U
nited 

S
tates involving 

use or potential

assist local

p'tcs.

S
eries, tM

 
S

uper 
B

ow
l, 

and 
tM

 
2002 W

inter 
O

lym

tory m
ust have a l

(2) O
ctober 1, 2002.

(3) T
o enhance

m
ass destruction

level, as an im

E
A

C
H

 S
T

A
T

E
.

M
A

S
S

 D
E

S
T

R
U

C
T

IO
N

 
C

IV
IL S

U
P

P
O

R
T

 T
E

A
M

 IN

P
R

O
V

IS
IO

N
S

(a) F
IN

D
IN

(i,~
.-C

on(Jress
i7 13

in 
the event 

of an

of M
ass D

11 
2001,

T
eam

s have responded to m
ore than 200 requests for

eaeh S
tate and tem

-

C
ivil 

S
U

'nvort

and have sup-

n~
akes the follow

il~
g f~

l~
dil~

gS
:

L- LC
ivil

C
ivil 

S
upport

S
upport 

T
eam

 
to 

respond 
to 

potential 
w

eapons 
of

for 
actual or potential

July 19, 2002
F

'W
7\()71 

q()?\()71 
q()? 

rn~

S
H

M
E

N
T

O
F

 A
T

 LE
A

S
T

 
O

N
E

 W
E

A
P

O
N

S
 O

F



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

14

(4) In section 1026 of the Bob Stump National1

2 Defense Authorization Act for Fiscal Year 2003 as

3 passed the House of Representatives on May 10, 2002

(H.R. 4546 of the 107th Congress), the House ofRep-4

resentatives has already taken action to that end by5

6 expressing tlw sense of Congress that the Secretary of

Defense should establish 23 additional Weapons of7

8 Mass Destruction Civil Support Teams in order to

provide at least one such tean~ in each State and ter-9

10 ritory.

(5) According to a September 2001 report of the1

Comptroll-er General entitl-ed "Co'1'11,bating Terrorism ",12

the Department of Defense plans that there eventually13

should be a Weapons of Mass Destruction Civil Sup-4

port Teams in each State, territory, and the District15

16 of Columbia.

-From funds authorized to be ap-17 (b) REQ[TIREMEj\'T.'

18 propriated in section 101, the Secretary of Defense shall en-

19 sure that there is established at least one Weapons of Mass

20 Destruction Civil Support Team in each State.

-For purposes of this section:21 (c) DEFINITIONS.-

"Weapons of Mass Destruction(1)22 The term

Civil Support Team" means a team of members of the23

reserve components of the armed forces that is estab-24

United

1231 

0 (c) of title 10,lished under section25

July 19, 2002
r:.\\17\/\71 O/\"\/\71nn" /\",



F:\CAS\REPORTSI \H4547 .RH

15

1 States Code, in support of emergency preparedness

2 progran~s to prepare for or to respond to any emer-

3 gency involving the use of a weapon of mass destruc-

4 lion

5 (2) Tlw term "State" includes the District of 00-

6 lumbia, Puerto Rico, the Virgin Islands, and Guan~.

7 (d) DE..WLINE ]1"'OR IM]:>I~EME1\!T..4TIOiV.

.The 

Secretary

8 of Defense shall ensure that subsection (b) is fully imple-

9 mented not later than September 30, 2003.

10 SEC. 302. AUTHORITY FOR JOINT TASK FORCES TO

1 PROVIDE SUPPORT TO LAW ENFORCEMENT

12 AGENCIES CONDUCTING COUNTER-TER-

13 RORISM ACTIVITIES.

14 (a) A [TTHORITY..-A joint task force of the Department

15 of Defense that provides support to law enforcement agen-

16 cies conducting counter-drug activities 11'l-ay a~o provide,

17 consistent with all applicabw laws and regulations, support

18 to law enforcement agencies conducting counter-terrorism

19 activities.

(b) CONDITION,S'. -Any support provided under sub-

21 section (a) may only be provided in the geographic area

22 of responsibility of the joint taskforce.

-Funds 

are hereby authorized to be appro-23 (c) F[lND.~..

24 priated for fiscal year 2003 in the amount of $5,000,000

July 19, 2002
F:\V7\O71 ~O?\O71 ~O? 01:'1



F:\CAS\REPORTSl \H4547 .RH

16

1 to provide support for counter-terrorism activities in ac-

2 cordance with subsections (a) and (b).

3 SEC. 303. SENSE OF CONGRESS ON ASSISTANCE TO FIRST

4 RESPONDERS.

5 It is the sense of Congress that the Secretary of Defense

6 should, to the extent the Secretary determines appropriate,

7 use funds provided in this Act to assist, train, and equip

8 local fire and police departments that would be a first re-

9 sponder to a domestic terrorist incident that may come

10 about in connection with the continued fight to prosecute

11 the war on terrorism.

July 19, 2002

F:\V7\071902\071902.013


