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Across 

1.  Some high-ranking 
employees are 
restricted in the 
_______ of money they 
can receive as outside 
earned income 

4.  You are to file and 
pay these by April 15th 

6.  You must use an 
approved _________ if 
you use your official 
title when writing an 
article in a scientific or 
professional journal as 
an outside activity 
 
 

7.  This act governs the 
political activities of 
executive branch 
employees 

10.  Find out if your 
agency requires 
____________ 
approval for outside 
employment or 
activities 

11. When fundraising 
in your personal 
capacity, one type of 
person from whom you 
can't solicit money is a 
___________ 

Down  

1. Only your ____ may 
authorize you to give an 
official speech at a 
fundraiser 

2. Don’t use your 
official _____ when 
fundraising in your 
personal capacity 

3. Generally you cannot 
accept money for 
speaking about your 
official ______ 

5. When speaking at a 
conference as an 
outside activity you 
may use your 
government title as one 
of several ___________
details 

 
HU

8. You can’t have an 
outside job when it 
______ with your 
official duties 

9. Generally when you 
teach, speak, or write 
about something related 
to your job, you have to 
do it for ___________ 
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