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SOCIN. SEtXlTUlT 

Mr. DOUGHTON. Mf. Speaker, I ask unanimous consent 
that I may have until midnight tonight to fl.le a report on 
the bill (R. R. 72601 to provide for the general welfare by
establishing a system of Federal old-age benefits, and by
enabling the several States to make more adequate provision
for aged persons, dependent and crippled children. maternal 
and child welfare, public health, and the administration of 
their unemployment compensation laws: to establhsh a Social 
Security Board: to raise revenue; and for other purposes.
And that any Member desiring to file individual or minority
views may have the same time~within which to file the same. 

The SPElAKER. Is there objection to the request of the 
gentleman from North Carolina? 

There was no objection 



5174 CONGRESSIONAL RECORD-HOUSE 1935 APRIL 6 


REPORTS OF COMMJXTE ES ON PUBLIC BILU3 AND 
RESOLUTIONS 

Under clause 2 of rule 2DII, 
Mr. DOUGHTON: Committee on Ways and Means. H. R 

7260. A bill to provide for the general welfare by establish­
ing a system of Federal old-age bene.fits. and by enabling thf 
several States to make more adequate provision for aged 
persons, dependent and crippled children, maternal and child 
welfare, public health, and the administration of their un 
employment compensation laws; to establtsh a Socia 
Security Board: to raise revenue: and for other purposes
without amendment (Rept. No. 615). Referred to the Corn, 
mittee of the Whole House on the state of the Union. 


